02/06/2023, 13:55 Gmail - RE: Commande N° CF049559

M Gmall Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>
RE: Commande N° CF049559

1 message

Emilien Poumerol <emilien.poumerol@mediprema.com> Fri, Jun 2, 2023 at 1:11 PM

To: "sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk" <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hello,

Ok for the price and we don't want insurance.

Thanks

Cordialement,

Emilien POUMEROL

Acheteur Approvisionneur

+33 (0)6 69 99 34 66

A J'- P . médipréma
'.:.[.;r médipréma group
gamain legros

ZA Node Park Touraine - 470 Rue Gilles de Gennes - BP 8 - 37310 Tauxigny - FRANCE

Tel +33 (0)2 47 28 47 87 — Fax +33 (0)2 47 27 35 85 - www.mediprema.com

French (@)

Médirunner,

Découvrir le Médirunner

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Sophie Lines
Envoyé : vendredi 2 juin 2023 13:01

A : Emilien Poumerol <emilien.poumerol@mediprema.com>

Objet : Re: Commande N° CF049559
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Dear Emilien,

Thank you for your order. Unfortunately the price you have quoted for part number 0330190 is incorrect - the price
per unit is $19.50 - please can you let me know if you are happy for us to proceed with your order at this price?

Furthermore, we have recently updated our insurance policy and procedure. Viamed’s product prices are supplied as
EXW (Ex-Works) Incoterms 2020. We now offer optional shipping insurance to distributors placing orders. Viamed’s
standard shipping service is via UPS' standard CPT (Carriage Paid To) delivery Incoterms 2020. This means that the
shipment is not covered by insurance for loss or damage once it leaves Viamed's premises over the shipment value
of $72.

As part of our distributor review we are now required to have written confirmation whether the goods will be covered
by your own insurance or if you wish for insurance to be added to your orders. Upgrading your deliveries to CIP
(Carriage and Insurance Paid) by adding an additional insurance premium at 1% of total goods value (minimum
charge of $12.50) means that any loss or damage during transit would be covered.

Please complete the attached existing distributor review form and return to us. In the meantime, please can you let
me know if you require insurance of $12.50 adding to this order, or if this is not something you require? If so,
would that be the case for all future orders?

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, Jun 2, 2023 at 10:24 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Emilien Poumerol <emilien.poumerol@mediprema.com>
Date: Fri, 2 Jun 2023 at 10:21

Subject: Commande N° CF049559

To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk <sarah.walton@yviamed.co.uk>
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Bonjour,

Veuillez trouver ci-joint notre commande N° CF049559.

Nous vous prions de bien vouloir confirmer la commande a arca@mediprema.com
Cordialement.

Emilien POUMEROL

Acheteur Approvisionneur

+33 (0)6 69 99 34 66
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