29/05/2023, 15:35 Gmail - Re: Order VANWEB1793 confirmed

M Gmall Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Re: Order VANWEB1793 confirmed

1 message

Izak Roux <izakroux70@gmail.com> 27 May 2023 at 16:33

To: Vandagraph <info@vandagraph.co.uk>
Good day
My Adress is 29 Derdelaan
Sandbaai
Hermanus
Western Cape
The location for delivery is 5km away from my location
Is it possible to correct this delivery address?
Pls
Izak Roux

On Sat, 27 May 2023, 15:41 Vandagraph, <info@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

) VANDAGRAPH LTD ,,..35%

Thank you for your purchase!

Hi I1zak, we're getting your order ready to be shipped. We will notify you when it
has been sent. We shall be in touch should there be any issues with stock
availability.

or Visit our store

Order summary

\‘ ‘ R-33VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110226) x 5 £275.00
N—

Subtotal £275.00

Shipping £15.00
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Taxes £0.00
Total £290.00 GBP

Customer information

Shipping address Billing address

Izak Roux Izak Roux

Dive Tech Centre Dive Tech Centre

29 Therd Ave 29 Therd Ave

Sandbaai Sandbaai

Hermanus Hermanus

Western Cape Western Cape

7200 7200

South Africa South Africa

Shipping method Payment method

Standard International =

ending with 0283

If you have any questions, reply to this email or contact us at info@vandagraph.co.uk
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