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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: CC details
1 message

Italgoods <info@italgoods.com> 23 May 2023 at 13:17
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan!
I shipped a couple of trimix analyzer to be checked/repaired.
I would like to order also 3 tek ox.
Thank You
Guido

Il giorno 13 apr 2023, alle ore 10:30, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> ha scritto:

Hi Guido

We did, thank you very  much.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 13 Apr 2023 at 09:28, Italgoods <info@italgoods.com> wrote:
Hi!
Did You receive our payment?
Regards

Il giorno 20 mar 2023, alle ore 17:15, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> ha scritto:

Sorry Guido

Our machine does not accept those card details, is it an Amex? I believe we only
accept mastercard or visa.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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