5/23/23,12:19 PM Gmail - Fwd: QUOTATION REQUEST FOR DRAGER 02 CELL ORGINAL

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: QUOTATION REQUEST FOR DRAGER 02 CELL ORGINAL

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 23 May 2023 at 12:06
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqgib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill
<janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi,
Please can we send a proforma to Oman Medical Supplies for 300x R-23V (0110023) including BC, insurance and
carriage.

Thank you, Ryan

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Tue, 23 May 2023 at 08:08

Subject: Fwd: QUOTATION REQUEST FOR DRAGER O2 CELL ORGINAL
To: <ryan.swaine@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Technical <technical@omanmed.com>

Date: Tue, 23 May 2023 at 07:51

Subject: RE: QUOTATION REQUEST FOR DRAGER 02 CELL ORGINAL
To: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

DEAR RYAN,

HOPE U R DOING WELL.

APPOLIGIZED FOR RE EMAIL

This is Akhil Das from Oman medical supplies in Oman. I'm writing this email to request a price quote for the

DRAGER 02-SENSOR , REF:6850645 ...QTY (300 PcS) NEW ORGINAL As PER THE COMPANY
RULES ,EACH QUOTATION WANT PERMOMA BILLS .SO,PLEASE CAN YOU MAKE PERFORMA INVOICE WITH
FRIGHT CHARGES

We're looking forward to hearing from you soon.

We'd like to get the quotation as soon as possible so that we can move ahead with the project. Do let us know if
there's anything else we can do to help make this process easier for you.

Look forward to hearing from you soon.

BEST REGARDS,

“OUR HEALTH IS OUR AIM”
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AKHILDAS SIVADASAN

BIOMEDICAL SALES &
SERVICE ENGINEER
technical@omanmed.com

+968 99388494

“Success is not final; failure is not fatal: it is the
courage to continue that counts.’

W in 3+

Website: http://omanmed.com/
Oman Medical Supplies And Service Co ..,

AL Nadha Towers 2,1St floor office number 1,
Gala p.o box: 1222, postal code: 121,seeb sultanate of oman.

Tel : +968 24593395 fax: +968 24596695

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, May 22, 2023 8:27 PM

To: Technical <technical@omanmed.com>

Subject: Re: QUOTATION REQUEST FOR DRAGER 02 CELL

Dear Akhildas Sivadasan

Thank you very much for your enquiry.

We can offer you our R-23V sensor which is compatible with the Draeger 6850645.

-

i Ter—r

M e

R-23V - pn: 0110023 = USD $43.75 each EXW

Please can you let us know when a decision is likely to be made and what sort of delivery schedule you require.

I look forward to your response and please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.

Best regards
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Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Technical <technical@omanmed.com>

Date: Mon, 22 May 2023 at 14:38

Subject: QUOTATION REQUEST FOR DRAGER 02 CELL

To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Cc: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

HI DEAR
HOPE U R DOING WELL.

This is Akhil Das from Oman medical supplies in Oman. I'm writing this email to request a price quote for the
DRAGER 02-SENSOR , REF:6850645 ...QTY (300 PCS)

We're looking forward to hearing from you soon.

We'd like to get the quotation as soon as possible so that we can move ahead with the project. Do let us know if
there's anything else we can do to help make this process easier for you.

Look forward to hearing from you soon.

BEST REGARDS,

“OUR HEALTH IS OUR AIM”

AKHILDAS SIVADASAN

BIOMEDICAL SALES &
SERVICE ENGINEER OMANMED,
technical@omanmed.com

+968 99388494

“Success is not final; failure is not fatal: it is the
courage to continue that counts.”

W in 3+
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Website: http://omanmed.com/
Oman Medical Supplies And Service Co ..,

AL Nadha Towers 2,1St floor office number 1,
Gala p.o box: 1222, postal code: 121,seeb sultanate of oman.

Tel : +968 24593395 fax: +968 24596695

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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