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M Gmall Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Fwd: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 22 May 2023 at 13:43
To: Agib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>

Date: Mon, 22 May 2023 at 13:34

Subject: RE: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>,
Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>

Cc: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>, janine.gill@viamed.co.uk <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,
Our import license has been approved, so we finally can proceed with the payment of this order.

For that, could you help us with some modifications we need you to do on the proforma:

* Modify the invoice issue date to a current one.
* Please add a future shipping date: 6/6/2023

Looking forward to your comments.

Thanks and regards,

u &

MEDICAL DEVICES

Culdamos |lo mas importante

Bianca Rodriguez | Analista Jr.
Bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar
+54 11 5295-2747

medix.com.ar

in]Ofw

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Kate Griffiths

Enviado el: martes, 11 de abril de 2023 05:15

Para: Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>; Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>;
Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>
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CC: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>; janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Asunto: Re: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Good morning,

Please see attached updated proforma invoice amended by our accounts director.

| hope this is acceptable for you.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Tue, 11 Apr 2023 at 08:09, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>

Date: Mon, 10 Apr 2023 at 13:21

Subject: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

To: Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>, sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>, Bianca Rodriguez
<bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>

Dear Janine,

This is a requirement of the Central Bank to be able to upload the payment to the bank and have it approved.
Please your cooperation to move forward with the process.

Thanks

Regards

MEDICAL DEVICES

Berenice Bajo | Analista SR
berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar
+54 11 5295-2747 TELEFONO| +54 9 11 CELULAR

medix.com.ar

in]O) v

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>

Enviado el: domingo, 9 de abril de 2023 22:33

Para: Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>

CC: Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>; Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>;
sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Asunto: RE: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Dear Janine,

Please note that we need you to modify the date even though it’s not going to be the real shipping date at last.
Please understand that we need you to make the changes in the proforma in order to proceed with the payment.

Secondly, could you please confirm if this information regarding the item id correct:
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Origin USA

Brand Teledyne

Thanks and regards,

= R - u &

MEDICAL DEVICES

)S 10 Mas IMporte

Bianca Rodriguez | Analista Jr.
Bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar
+54 11 5295-2747

medix.com.ar

in] O I

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Janine Gill

Enviado el: jueves, 6 de abril de 2023 05:28

Para: Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>

CC: Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>; Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>;
sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Asunto: Re: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Good Morning,

Thank you for your email.

Please find the amended Proforma attached.

Once the proforma has been paid we can then change the shipping date.
Please inform us which company will be used for shipping.

Feel free to contact us if you need any other info.
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Kind regards

Janine Gill
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 6 Apr 2023 at 08:18, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>

Date: Wed, 5 Apr 2023 at 17:23

Subject: RE: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>, Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>
Cc: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk>, Santiago Cornejo Saravia
<santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>

Dear Sophie,
We’ll need you to make some changes on the proforma invoice so we can proceed with the payment:
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Please change the date of issue of the invoice to an current one, take out the “valid until” and add to the
proforma the shipping date: 21/4/2023.

Contact Name : Santiago Cornejo Saravia
Contact Tel 1549115636 3814
Account 00006614

Customer Reference 6000003857

Date 30 Mar 2023

Priority :3

Valid until 30 Apr 2023

Regarding the incoterms, why CIP? Shouldn’t it be EXW? Please change that too.

Thanks and regards,

MEDICAL DEVICES

mos< lo macs importante
11U Williaos HNPLiLaliLlc

Bianca Rodriguez | Analista Jr.
Bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar
+54 11 5295-2747

medix.com.ar

®@ |#.TodoGratisInternet.com en Twitter | Icono de twitter, Autocad ...

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Sophie Lines

Enviado el: lunes, 3 de abril de 2023 05:23

Para: Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>

CC: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk; Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>; Santiago Cornejo Saravia
<santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: Re: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Good morning,
Thank you for your email. Please see the details below

TOTAL QUANTITY: 25x R-17MED Oxygen Sensors

TOTAL BOXES: 1 Box

DIMENSIONS: 31 x 31 x 31cm, 2.5 kg

PICK UP ADDRESS: Viamed Ltd, 15 Station Road, Cross Hills, BD20 7DT, United Kingdom

ORIGIN: Oxygen Sensor Country of Origin = U.S.A
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| hope this helps. If you require any further information please let me know.
Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main
office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited
and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call
+44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, Mar 31, 2023 at 8:39 PM Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Dear Sophie,

Hi! My name is Berenice, we need some information to quote the forwarder and ask the import license.

Please your help:

TOTAL QUANTITY:
TOTAL BOXES
DIMENSIONS

PICK UP ADDRESS
ORIGIN

Thanks

Regards
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mediX

MEDICAL DEVICES

Cuidamos lo mas importante

Berenice Bajo | Analista SR
berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar
+54 11 5295-2747 TELEFONO| +54 9 11 CELULAR

medix.com.ar

@@ QTodoGratislnternet.com en Twitter | Icono de twitter, Autocad ...

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>

Enviado el: viernes, 31 de marzo de 2023 12:46

Para: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

CC: Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>; Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>;
janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Asunto: RE: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Thanks Sophie! We will let you know once the payment is done, first we need the import license. Bianca and
Berenice will contact you regarding this issue.

Have a nice weekend,

mediX

MEDICAL DEVICES

Cuidamos lo mas importante

Santiago Cornejo Saravia| Gerente de compras y comercio exterior
santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar
+54 9 11 5636 3814

medix.com.ar

Q QLogo Instagram PNG transparente - StickPNG
QTodoGratislnternet.com en Twitter | Icono de twitter, Autocad ...

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui
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De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Sophie Lines

Enviado el: viernes, 31 de marzo de 2023 12:37

Para: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>

CC: Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>; Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>;
janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Asunto: Re: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Hi Santiago,

Thank you for your reply - please find attached your amended Proforma Invoice with the bank charges
removed, as requested.

If you require any further information or changes, please let me know and | will be happy to help.
Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main
office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or
call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, Mar 31, 2023 at 4:25 PM Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Sophie,

| confirm you that our payment will include all the fees, it’s free of charges for you. Please send me the
amended PI.

Regards,
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Santiago Cornejo Saravia| Gerente de compras y comercio exterior
santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar
+54 9 11 5636 3814

medix.com.ar

®“:Logo Instagram PNG transparente - StickPNG
|+ TodoGratisInternet.com en Twitter | Icono de twitter, Autocad ...

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Santiago Cornejo Saravia

Enviado el: viernes, 31 de marzo de 2023 12:09

Para: viamedinbox@gmail.com; sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

CC: Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>; Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: RV: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Dear Sophie,

Thanks for your email. Please do not remove Berenice and Bianca from the emails, they are from our
foreign trade department and they will coordinate and confirm any information regarding the shipment.
Regarding bank charges, | guess we cover all fees but | can’t confirm because may be your local bank
charges some fees.

Thanks and regards,

Santiago Cornejo Saravia| Gerente de compras y comercio exterior
santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar
+54 9 11 5636 3814

medix.com.ar
in]O I
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Sophie Lines
Enviado el: viernes, 31 de marzo de 2023 11:56

Para: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: Re: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Dear Santiago,

Thank you for your email - Janine is not in the office today, so please accept my reply.

Please find attached your amended Proforma Invoice as per your requests - please can you provide details
of which courier you use? With regards to the bank charges, if you agree to cover all fees when making the
transfer, we can also remove these from your Proforma Invoice.

If you have any questions please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the
main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line
or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, Mar 31, 2023 at 3:02 PM Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Hello Janine,
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Thank you. Please note that we didn’t know before about bank charges. We don’t need Insurance and
UPS courier service as it is detailed on the proforma, we buy EXW and we have our own insurance and
freight forwarder. Please send us the amended proforma invoice (pieces + bank charges) so we can pay
it.

Thanks and best regards,

Santiago Cornejo Saravia| Gerente de compras y comercio exterior
santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar
+54 9 11 5636 3814

medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Janine Gill
Enviado el: jueves, 30 de marzo de 2023 06:50

Para: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>

CC: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Asunto: Re: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

Good Morning,
Thank you for your email.
Please find the proforma attached as requested.

Please check the names, addresses, and items are correct, if you need anything changing do let me
know.

Be aware full payment will be needed before any goods are dispatched.

Please feel free to contact me if you need any other info.
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Kind regards

Janine Gill
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 30 Mar 2023 at 09:04, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>

Date: Wed, 29 Mar 2023 at 21:43

Subject: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>, Berenice Bajo
<berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>

Dear Sophie,
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How are you? Please find attached our PO for 0110017 Teledyne Oxygen Sensor R-17MED, we will
prepaid from Argentina. Berenice and Bianca from our foreign trade department (RIC) will ask you for

some information they need for the import license.

Thanks and best regards,

, 9

n &~

MEDICAL DEVICES

Santiago Cornejo Saravia| Gerente de compras y comercio exterior
santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar
+54 9 11 5636 3814

medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Santiago Cornejo Saravia

Enviado el: martes, 28 de marzo de 2023 11:42
Para: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Asunto: RE: RFQ

Dear Sophie,

Thanks for your email, | sent it to accounts payable. | will confirm soon if we will pay from MEDIX

Argentina or XIDEM USA (our subsidiary in the USA).

Regards,

Santiago Cornejo Saravia| Gerente de compras y comercio exterior
santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar

+54 9 11 5636 3814

medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Sophie Lines
Enviado el: martes, 28 de marzo de 2023 09:36

Para: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: Re: RFQ

Good afternoon,

Thank you for your email. | can confirm payment would be required up front, as your account with us
is currently on stop due to a previous invoice remaining unpaid - if you need further details, please
contact our finance department - helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk.

The R-17MED Oxygen Sensor is currently available for immediate dispatch upon receipt of payment.

If you require any further assistance please do not hesitate to contact us
Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it,
is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-a:r-6567635198639890776&simpl=msg-a:r-6567635...

15/18


https://ar.linkedin.com/company/medixmedicaldevices
https://www.instagram.com/medixmedicaldevices/
https://twitter.com/medix_md
https://linktr.ee/medixmedicaldevices
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar
mailto:helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy

22/05/2023, 14:21 Gmail - Fwd: 6000003857 - VIAMED LTD

On Mon, Mar 27, 2023 at 6:27 PM Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>
wrote:

Dear Sophie,

Thanks for your email. Payment terms are prepaid? | will confirm soon if we will pay from MEDIX
or XIDEM. Would you please confirm lead time once we pay?

Thanks and best regards,

MEDICAL DEVICES

Santiago Cornejo Saravia| Gerente de compras y comercio exterior
santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar
+54 9 11 5636 3814

medix.com.ar

41, Logo Instagram PNG transparente - StickPNG
[# TodoGratisInternet.com en Twitter | Icono de twitter, Autocad ...

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Sophie Lines
Enviado el: viernes, 24 de marzo de 2023 11:21

Para: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: Re: RFQ

Dear Santiago,

Thank you for your email.

| can confirm the price for the R-17MED Oxygen Sensor is $43.10 each EXW - please can you
confirm whether you would like me to send you a Proforma invoice with Xidem billing details as in
the past, or should the delivery and invoice address both be Medix in Argentina?

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on
it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, Mar 24, 2023 at 8:29 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>
Date: Thu, 23 Mar 2023 at 19:31

Subject: RFQ

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Hello,

My name is Santiago Cornejo, purchasing and foreign trade manager at Medix Argentina.
Please, | need you to quote us 25 pieces of item 0110017 Teledyne Oxygen Sensor R-17MED

Please detail unit price, payment terms and lead time once you confirm the order.

For your reference, you can find attached the Pl from our last shipment of this item with you.

Thank you very much.

Best regards,
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Santiago Cornejo Saravia| Gerente de compras y comercio exterior
santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar
+54 9 11 5636 3814

medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Bianca Rodriguez <bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar>

Enviado el: jueves, 23 de marzo de 2023 16:04

Para: Santiago Cornejo Saravia <santiago.cornejo@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: OCI 3750

H:\CExterior\2022\03. Importaciones\OCI6000003750 (ex3725) - VIAMED

L

Bianca Rodriguez | Analista Jr.
Bianca.rodriguez@medix.com.ar
+54 11 5295-2747

medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui
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