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---------- Forwarded message --------- From: RAY, Carl (THE SHREWSBURY AND TELFORD HOSPITAL NHS TRUST) <carl.ray@n
Main Account

Good Morning Carl, Thank you for your email. The prices for the R47V are: 1 = £ 75.002 = £ 71.253 = £ 67.5011 = £ 63.75 If you w
Emily Hanson

to emily.hanson@viamed.co.uk

RAY, Carl (THE SHREWSBURY AND TELFORD HOSPITAL NHS TRUST)

Hi Emily, 
               This is brilliant, thank you. Could you send and official quote for 3 and I will get them ordered 

Kind Regards

Carl Ray
Team Leader
Medical Engineering Services
Princess Royal Hospital
Apley Castle
Telford
TF1 6TF
01952 641222 ext 4260

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Emily Hanson <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, 22 May 2023, 10:16
To: RAY, Carl (THE SHREWSBURY AND TELFORD HOSPITAL NHS TRUST) <carl.ray@nhs.net>
Subject: Re: R-47V

  This message originated from outside of NHSmail. Please do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know
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