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M Gma” Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>

Fwd: ORDER confirmation - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> 17 May 2023 at 11:06
Reply-To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

—————————— Forwarded message --—--—-----

From: <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>

Date: Wed, 17 May 2023 at 10:29

Subject: ORDER confirmation - 0110081 UFO 130-2
To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Kate,

OK, please send me your invoice for 10 sensors including shipment to Belgium.
Best regards,

Philip De Visscher

Vogelkers bv

Maria van Zimmerenstraat 14

B-2300 Turnhout
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VAT : BE0464.072.843

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Tuesday, 16 May 2023 12:32

To: philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Hi Philip,

There used to be a quantity discount, but the pricing structure has recently been changed.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Tue, 16 May 2023 at 11:20, philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Kate,

Thanks for the prompt follow-up. Wasn't there a 10 unit volume discount ? Or was that for 12 pieces ?

Regards,

Philip

Sent from my Galaxy

From: Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: 5/16/23 11:58 (GMT+01:00)

To: "philip.de.visscher" <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Good morning Philip,

Thank you for your email.

The price for part number 0110081 - Oxygen sensor UFO 130-2 is €203.90 each EXW. | have attached a price
list.

The approximate lead time would be mid June.

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths
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Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 16 May 2023 at 10:13, philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Kate,

I hope all is well. I'd like to order 10 additional sensors. Can you confirm the price?

Thanks,

Philip

Sent from my Galaxy
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From: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: 1/31/23 14:57 (GMT+01:00)
To: "philip.de.visscher" <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Thank you Philip @

| am glad we finally got somewhere!

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Tue, 31 Jan 2023 at 13:50, philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Kate,

Thank you so much! As unhelpfull your distributor is, the more fantastic you are.

Best regards,

Philip

Sent from my Galaxy

From: Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: 1/31/23 14:12 (GMT+01:00)

To: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com

Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Good afternoon Philip,

Good news! Your parcel will be shipped later today and a colleague will email you the tracking number when
the goods leave our warehouse.

Thank you for your patience.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 27 Jan 2023 at 15:35, <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Kate,

Thanks for the follow up.

Have a nice weekend,

Philip

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Friday, 27 January 2023 15:00

To: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com

Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Good afternoon Philip,

| am sorry for the delay in my reply. | am still awaiting a reply from the warehouse team. | have not had a
definite no, so | am still hopeful and have explained the previous delay with us not being able to supply
your sensors when you first contacted us.
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| remain hopeful but hesitant and will let you know as soon as | hear any news.

Thank you for your patience.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 25 Jan 2023 at 19:44, <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Kate,
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Any good news? | appreciate your help — A LOT !!! But for my customer this has been going on for ... 5
months.

Best regards,

Philip

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Thursday, 19 January 2023 15:03

To: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com

Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Good afternoon Philip,

Thank you for your payment.

| think unfortunately this order will have a lead time of approximately 5-6 weeks.

It may be that the warehouse can manage to ship your order from our current stock, | have asked them
if this is possible, since the delay you experienced before we could place your order. | may have some
better news for you next week, but most likely the lead time will be approximately 5-6 weeks.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.

Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 16 Jan 2023 at 10:16, <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Good morning !

This is all perfect. The invoice is paid.

Any idea of the lead time ?

Best regards,

Philip

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Monday, 16 January 2023 10:47

To: philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Good morning Philip,

Please see attached proforma invoice as requested. | have added the carriage charge for unboxed
Sensors.

| have used the addresses as follows:
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Delivery Address

GR Technics

Attn Inne Hofkens
Beemdenstraat 38
Beerse

2340

Belgium

Please let me know if you require any changes to be made. The proforma invoice is valid for 30

days.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where

possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Invoice Address

\ogelkers Bv

Maria Van Zimmerenstraat 14
Turnhout

2300

Belgium

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or

omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,

please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Sun, 15 Jan 2023 at 17:15, philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Kate,

The sensors can all go together in one box.

Regards,

Philip

Sent from my Galaxy

From: Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: 1/15/23 18:03 (GMT+01:00)
To: "philip.de.visscher" <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

HI Philip,

Thank you for your reply. Please accept my apologies, | meant do you need each sensor to be
packed in its own box, or are they ok in their sealed packets in the outer box? The warehouse
ensure that for either method the sensors are packed safely and securely. (This information is
requested so | can obtain the correct weights and dimensions to work out the shipping cost)

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Sun, 15 Jan 2023 at 16:48, philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Hello again,

My tel nris +32 475 26 67 85. The sensors can be packed together ; but no partial delivery.

Best regards,

Philip

Sent from my Galaxy

From: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>
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Date: 1/15/23 17:16 (GMT+01:00)

To: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com

Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Good afternoon Philip,

Thank you for your reply, | will finish your proforma invoice tomorrow when | am in the office.

In the meantime, please could | ask if you would like the sensors individually boxed or bulk
packed? Also, please could | ask for a contact telephone number? UPS require one, so |
need to add it to your proforma invoice.

We have a small amount available from stock, subject to being quality assessed. Stock levels
change constantly of course!

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in
the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email
where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Sun, 15 Jan 2023 at 14:36, <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Kate,

Thanks for your assistance (again) !

I'd like to order 10 units. Please invoice me :

Vogelkers bv

Maria van Zimmerenstraat 14

2300 Turnhout Belgium

BE0464.072.843

The shipment can go to :

GR Technics

Attn Inne Hofkens

Beemdenstraat 38

2340 Beerse

What is the lead time?

Best regards,

Philip

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Wednesday, 11 January 2023 12:01

To: philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2
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Good morning Philip,

Happy New Year.

| have been asked by our Export Manager to quote you our pricing as Ron has been unable
to assist you. | am sorry that this was not something we were able to do from the start.

The price breaks for part number 0110081 - oxygen sensor UFO 130-2 are as follows:

1=€ 2=€157.82 3-10 = € 149.05 each 11 or more = € 140.28
175.35 each EXW EXW each EXW

| would like to set up a new account for you if you still require these sensors and are happy
for us to supply them. Please could | ask you for your delivery and invoice addresses and
telephone number?

How many would you require?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in

the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use
email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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17/05/2023, 11:12 Gmail - Fwd: ORDER confirmation - 0110081 UFO 130-2
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken
or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 11 Jan 2023 at 07:37, philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Ron,

I've placed this order in November of last year. | sent several requests for invoice and
delivery, | left voice messages on your answering machine, | sent messages by Whatsapp
(which you read and once replied with a promise to do the necessary the next day), I've
been at your office (closed doors), ... What else can | do to get these goods delivered ?

If you refuse to deliver me these goods, please let me know ! In case you agree to deliver,
please confirm urgently.

Thanks,

Philip

Sent from my Galaxy

From: "philip.de.visscher" <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>
Date: 12/2/22 06:51 (GMT+01:00)

To: 'info' <info@medicalessentials.be>

Subject: RE: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Ron

Heb je al een verwachte leverdatum ?
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Ik heb nog geen factuur ontvangen - anders had ik deze al kunnen betalen.

Mvg

Philip

Sent from my Galaxy

From: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com
Date: 23/11/2022 15:31 (GMT+01:00)
To: 'info’ <info@medicalessentials.be>

Subject: BESTELLING - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Ron

Ik heb eindelijk de betaling ontvangen en kan de bestelling bevestigen van :

10 x 02 sensor UFO-130-2 @ 200,00€ - 20%.

Gelieve me uw factuur toe te sturen, zodat ik u onmiddellijk kan betalen. Wat is de
leveringstermijn ?

Met vriendelijke groeten

Philip De Visscher

Vogelkers bv

Maria van Zimmerenstraat 14
2300 Turnhout
BE0464.072.843

From: philip.de.visscher <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 10 October 2022 17:25

To: info <info@medicalessentials.be>

Subject: RE: Website question - 0110081 UFO 130-2
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Super !

Philip

Sent from my Galaxy

From: info <info@medicalessentials.be>
Date: 10/10/2022 15:52 (GMT+01:00)
To: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Website question - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Normaal is levering via bpost dus 7 €

Groeten

Van: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>
Verzonden: maandag 10 oktober 2022 11:54

Aan: info <info@medicalessentials.be>

CC: Ron Vanstraelen <ron@medicalessentials.be>

Onderwerp: RE: Website question - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Urgentie: Hoog

Ron

Wat zijn de leveringskosten ? Of kom ik dat halen ? Ik heb deze info dringend nodig voor
mijn offerte ...

Mvg

Philip

From: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 6 October 2022 16:32

To: 'info' <info@medicalessentials.be>

Cc: ron@medicalessentials.be

Subject: RE: Website question - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Importance: High
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Ron,

Perfect | Dan neem ik er 12 stuks @ 200,00€ - 20%. Kom ik deze bij jullie halen, of
verstuur je die (port kosten ?) ?

Vogelkers bv
Maria van Zimmerenstraat 14
230 Turnhout

BE0464.072.843

Met vriendelijke groeten

Philip De Visscher

From: info <info@medicalessentials.be>

Sent: Thursday, 6 October 2022 15:54

To: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Website question - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Yes it is

Van: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>
Verzonden: donderdag 6 oktober 2022 15:33

Aan: Ron Vanstraelen <ron@medicalessentials.be>

CC: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk; info <info@medicalessentials.be>
Onderwerp: RE: Website question - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Ron,

As discussed by phone this afternoon, | will quote 200€ for 1 unit, and 20% discount for 5
units or more.

Correct ?

Philip

From: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 21 September 2022 12:35
To: ron@medicalessentials.be
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Cc: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk; info@m-e.be
Subject: FW: Website question - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Hello,

Can you give me the price for O2 sensor UFO-130-2 ? Please quote unit price, and price
for 5 or 10 units.

Thanks you,

Philip De Visscher

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Wednesday, 21 September 2022 12:17

To: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com

Subject: Re: Website question - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Good morning Philip.

Thank you for your email.

We have a business partner in Belgium called Medical Essentials BVBA. Please could you
contact Ron Vanstraelen? His email address is ron@medicalessentials.be

| hope this is acceptable to you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and
in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to
use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action
taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 21 Sept 2022 at 10:44, <philip.de.visscher@gmail.com> wrote:

Hello,

Can you give me the price for O2 sensor UFO-130-2 ? Please quote unit price, and
price for 5 or 10 units.

Thanks you,

Philip De Vischer

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Tuesday, 13 September 2022 17:07

To: philip.de.visscher@gmail.com

Subject: Website question - 0110081 UFO 130-2

Good afternoon Philip,

Thank you for your enquiry via our website.

We have a business partner in Belgium called Medical Essentials BVBA.
Ron Vanstraelen will contact you shortly.

| hope this is acceptable to you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely
and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action
taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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