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M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Fwd: FW: [External] Renewal of registration
1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 May 2023 at 11:33
Reply-To: steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk
To: ryan.swaine@vmsecure.me.uk

As discussed

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Irma Fejzi¢ <irma@dremedical.ba>
Date: Tue, 16 May 2023 at 11:13

Subject: FW: [External] Renewal of registration
To: <Steve.Nixon@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Mr. Nixon,

| am writing you in front of company Dre Medical d.o.0. located in Bosnia and Herzegovina. We have been
cooperating for long time with company Envitec who has redirected us this year to you in case we need some offers,
as you can see from our communication with Mrs. Wagner.

| would like to ask you to send us Advance Invoice on e-mail in accordance of previously agreed terms of
cooperation.

Also since are registration renewal for sensors is expiring soon and we will need renewal, | would like to know who |
can reach out for documentation that's needed for registration (DOC, ISO 13485, EC certificate, Free Sale, Labels,
IFU...).

Thank you very much,

Kind Regards,

Irma Fejzi¢

Dre Medical doo
Spasovdanska br. 25

71123 Isto€no Sarajevo

Tel:+ 387 57 344-935
Fax:+ 387 57 344-936

Mob:+ 387 65 258-931
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From: Wagner, Jessica (GEQY) [mailto:Jessica.Wagner@Honeywell.com]
Sent: Thursday, May 11, 2023 6:00 PM

To: Irma Fejzi¢ <irma@dremedical.ba>

Cc: 'info' <info@dremedical.ba>

Subject: AW: [External] Renewal of registration

Dear Irma,

thank you very much for your email. We changed our sales channels and for any product request you can ask at one
of our authorized distributor for any price offers:

Viamed Ltd
Mr. Steve Nixon

Steve.Nixon@Viamed.co.uk
Or

Nissha Medical Technologies

Nicolas Baudet/ Director of sales — Europe
Email: nbaudet@nisshamedical.com

O: +33139726666 | M: +33 6 89 49 52 05

https://nisshamedical.com/

or

Diagramm Halbach GmbH & Co. KG/ Germany
Export manager — Mr. Andreas Becker

Tel: +49 2304 75967

Mobil: +49 173 2705497

Mail: andreas.becker@halbach.com

Web: www.halbach.com/shop
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They would be pleased to help you in any case.

Kind regards / Mit freundlichen Gruessen

i.A. Jessica Wagner

Inside Sales Rep.

Honeywell | SPS | Honeywell Sensing and Safety Technologies
Honeywell Healthcare Solutions GmbH

Office: +49 3841 360 206

Fax:  +49 3841 360 222

Jessica.Wagner@honeywell.com

https://sps.honeywell.com/de/de/products/sensing-and-iot/sensors

Honeywell Healthcare Solutions GmbH
Alter Holzhafen 18

23966 Wismar, Germany

Trade Register: Schwerin, HRB 1838
Managing Directors: Marcus Ostlander

Von: Irma Fejzi¢ <irma@dremedical.ba>

Gesendet: Donnerstag, 11. Mai 2023 16:12

An: Stefan.Dreyer@Honeywell.com

Cc: Wagner, Jessica (GEQY) <Jessica.Wagner@Honeywell.com>; 'info' <info@dremedical.ba>
Betreff: [External] Renewal of registration

Some people who received this message don't often get email from irma@dremedical.ba. Learn why this is important

WARNING: This message has originated from an External Source. This may be a phishing
email that can result in unauthorized access to Honeywell systems. Please use proper
judgment and caution when opening attachments, clicking links or responding.

Dear Mr. Dreyer,
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I am writing you on behalf of company Dre Medical from Sarajevo. Since | am assigned to deal with documentation
and making sure that our registrations are in date | would like to ask you to guide me through.

As you are aware that your company had changed name and registration is almost out of date, Agency for Medicinal

products and Medical devices has listed mandatory documents so we can renew registration and supply them with
updated documents.

Please be kind and send to me on e-mail documents listed below:
« Statement in which you declare that the company has changed name. Please sign it and stamp in pdf file
e New ISO certificate

e Updated packaging labels for medical devices; Flow sensor and O2 sensors
e Original user manual for both devices

Documentation listed below should be ORIGINAL and sent to our company address:

¢ Letter of Authorization
e EC certificate, (Original or notarized in country of manufacturer)
e Declaration of Conformity for both devices ( Flow sensor and O2 sensors)

In case of any kind of additional questions, please don’t hesitate to contact me.
Address for documentation delivery is below my name.

Kind Regards,

Irma Fejzi¢

Dre Medical doo

Spasovdanska br. 25

71123 Isto€no Sarajevo

Tel:+ 387 57 344-935

Fax:+ 387 57 344-936
Mob:+ 387 65 258-931
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Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

@ Purchase order.doc
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