15/05/2023, 10:45 Gmail - Re: O2 Sensors

M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: O2 Sensors
1 message

Harry Syson <harry@lovemedical.com>
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Thanks Kate!

. Harry
LOVG med | COI Financial Officer

Cardiopulmonary Diagnostics | Love Medical Ltd
P: +44 161 976 2744

A: Unit 1 Willan Enterprise Centre | Fourth Avenue, Village, Trafford Park, Manchester, M17 1DB
W: www.lovemedical.com
E: harry@lovemedical.com
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On Fri, 12 May 2023 at 17:06, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon Harry,

No problem, | will amend your order on Monday.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to us
http://www.viamed.co.uk
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On Fri, 12 May 2023 at 16:49, Harry Syson <harry@lovemedical.com> wrote:
Hi Kate,

| know one of the sensors is out of stock, is it possible to add one more of the 0110081’s to the order and have them both sent as soon as possible? Happy to pay for the extra post
Kind regards
Kind regards

On Wed, 3 May 2023 at 11:44, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Harry,

Further to my email yesterday, are you happy to accept the correct price of part number 0110081 is £167.10 each? Would you like me to proceed?
| also need to inform you that part number 0110566 has a lead time of approximately 8-10 weeks.

| await your reply.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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On Tue, 2 May 2023 at 11:10, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Harry Syson <harry@lovemedical.com>
Date: Tue, 2 May 2023 at 10:57

Subject: Re: O2 Sensors

To: <office@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

| hope you are well.

Please find a purchase order attached for one of each type of cell. If anything needs adding to it or amending please do let me know.
Please could you let me know the best way to pay for this aswell?

Kind regards

. Harry
LOVG med | CQI Financial Officer

Cardiopulmonary Diagnostics | Love Medical Ltd
P: +44 161 976 2744

A: Unit 1 Willan Enterprise Centre | Fourth Avenue, Village, Trafford Park, Manchester, M17 1DB
W: www.lovemedical.com
E: harry@lovemedical.com
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On Sat, 15 Apr 2023 at 20:56, Julialn Syson <julian@lovemedical.com> wrote

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Fri, 14 Apr 2023 at 14:38

Subject: Re: O2 Sensors

To: <liam@]lovemedical.com>

Good afternoon Liam,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The price breaks are as follows:

0110081 - Oxygen sensor UFO 130-2

[1=£167.10 [ 2 =£ 163.00 each [ [3-10 = £ 163.00 each [ [11 or more = £ 1¢

This sensor is currently in stock.

0110566 - Oxygen sensor OOM109-LF2

[1=£105.00 [ [2 =£99.75 each [ [3-10= £ 94.50 each [T11 or more = £ 89

This sensor is a non stock item and would have a lead time, | am unable to supply that just yet.

Carriage is free for medical oxygen sensors and all prices are excluding VAT.

Please could | ask for an email address for your accounts and/or invoicing team? | can then update your credit account.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please conti
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On Fri, 14 Apr 2023 at 12:48, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Liam Vernon <liam@Ilovemedical.com>
Date: Fri, 14 Apr 2023 at 12:45

Subject: O2 Sensors

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Guys
Can | get an updated quote on the current price and availability of

0110081
0110566

BW
Liam :)

Liam Vernon

Customer Support Manager
Love Medical Ltd
P: +44 161 976 2744 M: +44 771 888 4791

A: Unit 1 Willan Enterprise Centre | Fourth Avenue, Village, Trafford Park, Manchester, M17 1DB
W: www.lovemedical.com

LOV@ mGCJ i CQI E: liam@lovemedical.com

Cardiopulmonary Diagnostics .
C:_https://calendly.com/liamvernon

Y Dam

Best Regards

Julian Syson

LOVGmGdlCQl Managing Director

Cardiopumanary Diagrostics Love Medical Ltd
P:+44 161 976 2744

A: Unit 1 Willan Enterprise Centre | Fourth Avenue, Village, Trafford Park, Manchester, M17 1DB
W: www.lovemedical.com
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