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M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

SV: 02 sensors
1 message

Post Post Post <post@maskinogdykkerservice.no> 4 May 2023 at 16:12
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Rayan

Can you send me the following:
R33DE sensor 5 stk.

R-22VAN 3 stk.

| also need 1 stk. sensor for

NTS O2 blender (www.nts.com) ( similar to R-17VAN og maybe R-41V??? (Has a jack plug )

Remember to include org. nr.955874390 and toll nr. 30316042 On shipping papers
Invoice email direct to accounting: 854923069477080@voucher.24sevenoffice.com
Ha en fin dag./Have a nice day Afternoon

Mvh.Ole Martin Lind

TIf. 0047 48252188

Maskin og DykkerService Org. Nr. 955874390

Molland 35,

4887 Grimstad

Norway

Mvh.Ole Martin Lind
TIf. 48252188

Maskin og DykkerService

Fra: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Pa vegne av Ryan Swaine
Sendt: mandag 24. april 2023 18:08

Til: Post Post Post <post@maskinogdykkerservice.no>

Emne: Re: O2 sensors

Dear Martin

Thank you very much for your email.

Please find our latest trade and retail pricing attached. The sensor you require for the NTS is the R-17VAN.
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Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 24 Apr 2023 at 14:35, Post Post Post <post@maskinogdykkerservice.no> wrote:

Good Afternoon

It's that time of year again, Spring is finally move

and the diving activity is picking up every week.

Can you please send me an updated retail price list without vat.
And the dealer price list without vat.

If you can manage a better discount it would be much appreciated.

| looked at your O2 list and didn’t find “NTS analyzer “ Nitrox blender.

Do you have the cell for that.

Have a nice day

Ha en fin dag.

Mvh.Ole Martin Lind

TIf. 0047 48252188

Maskin og DykkerService

Molland 35, 4887 Grimstad

Org. Nr. 955874390

Aut. Salg og Service, teknisk instrukter

Scubapro Dykkerutstyr
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Padi Dykkersenter

Bauer, L&W and Coltri HT. kompressorer

Karcher proff maskiner
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