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M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Updated address

1 message

Divestop Cyprus <dive@divestopcyprus.com> 27 April 2023 at 20:13
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan
| hope this email finds you well
Please can you update the proforma for my order with the following address

Gavin Jones

ASH GROVE

OVERTON ROAD ST MARTINS
OSWESTRY, SY11 3DG

United Kingdom

Phone number: +44 7887509077

Thank you for your assistance,

Best Regards

Will Stratford

Managing Director,

Dive Stop Cyprus
www.divestopcyprus.com

0035796039632
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2023 11:05:44 AM

To: Divestop Cyprus <dive@divestopcyprus.com>

Subject: Re: Vandagraph Proforma

Thank you Will, just let us know the address details when you have them.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 26 Apr 2023 at 15:50, Divestop Cyprus <dive@divestopcyprus.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan

| hope this email finds you well, | completely forgot about the PF | still want the sensors | have someone coming
over on the 4th of May
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| will send you their delivery address to update tent proforma

Best Regards

Will Stratford

Managing Director,

Dive Stop Cyprus
www.divestopcyprus.com
0035796039632
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Wednesday, April 26, 2023 12:43:29 PM

To: Divestop Cyprus <dive@divestopcyprus.com>

Subject: Vandagraph Proforma

Hi Will

| hope you are well.

Please can you let me know if the attached proforma invoice is still valid or should we delete it?
| will await your reply.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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