
24/04/2023, 11:25 Gmail - Re: Proforma invoice for 1 x 0110072
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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Proforma invoice for 1 x 0110072
1 message

Paul Foster <paulfoster@antservices.co.uk> 24 April 2023 at 11:21
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate

That's fine, thank you .

Kind regards.

Paul.

On Mon, Apr 24, 2023 at 11:03 AM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Paul,

Please see attached proforma invoice.  If you are happy with it, please reply to this email and I will turn it to a
confirmed order and ask my colleague Cathy Green to ring you on 07796710733 for payment.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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--
Paul Foster
Field Service Engineer
Anaesthetic Technical Services LTD
Tel: 01256 693130
Fax: 01256 693102
Mob: 07796 710733
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