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1 message

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> 21 April 2023 at 14:51
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

Thank you for your email.
Please send a new proforma invoice for 01 Pc R-49V and 06 Pcs R-22MEDV oxygen sensors.

Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Apr 21, 2023 at 4:23 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Sudath,

The warehouse have confirmed we can ship only one R-49V to you.  Shall I issue you with a proforma invoice for
one?  If so, do I need to amend your other proforma invoice?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Fri, 21 Apr 2023 at 11:36, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Good afternoon Kate,

Available 1Pc or 2 R-49V? Because too urgent 

Best regards,
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