20/04/2023, 11:37 Gmail - Re: New SDS Order 7204

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: New SDS Order 7204

1 message

Madi Kirby <madi@sdswatersports.co.uk> 19 April 2023 at 17:46

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan
Thank you for getting back to me so quickly!
if you could please change the r-22 to the R-33DE that would be wonderful!
Thank you!
Kind Regards
Madi
On 19/04/2023 17:27, Ryan Swaine wrote:
Dear Madi

Thank you very much for your email.

Please find your proforma invoice attached, please let me know when the payment has been made or if
you have any questions.

Please note that the R-22DEM you have ordered are not often purchased these days, as they are for
the very early version of the Analox O2EII (over 15 years old). Most O2EIl analysers now use the R-
33DE. | have attached a leaflet with a picture of both types, please let me know if you wish to change it.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 19 Apr 2023 at 16:03, Madi Kirby <madi@sdswatersports.co.uk> wrote:
Good Afternoon

Hope this email finds you well, could we have an order for the following

4 x Tek-ox
1 x R-22DEM Diving O2 sensor (0110225)

Please let me know if there are any issues
Kindest Regards

Madi
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