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Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order - oxygen sensor
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 20 April 2023 at 09:10
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Hi, please can we process this order and send them a proforma invoice.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Martin Satola <satola@proat.cz>
Date: Thu, 20 Apr 2023 at 08:45
Subject: Order - oxygen sensor
To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan

 

I order

3pcs R-17MED sensors  - EUR €58.80 each EXW.

Oficial purchase order is attached
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Please ship this sensors to Czech Republic - adress in attached purchase order

Off course add price for shipping to final invoice

 

Best Regards

 

 

Ing. Martin Satola

Motosin 216
75301 Hranice

Czech Republic
tel. +420 608 836 553
e-mail: satola@proat.cz

VAT: CZ8101165864

 

 

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Thursday, April 13, 2023 12:23 PM
To: satola@proat.cz
Subject: Re: Inquiry oxygen sensor

 

Dear Martin

 

Thank you very much for your enquiry.

 

The R-17MED sensors are GBP £53 / EUR €58.80 each EXW.
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You can place your order via our new website (in GBP) or we can send you a proforma invoice in either GBP or EUR, which can be paid by bank transfer.

 

The link to the R-17MED on our new website:

R-17MED Oxygen Sensor – Viamed Ltd

 

Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.

 

Kind regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

On Thu, 13 Apr 2023 at 10:37, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Martin Satola <satola@proat.cz>
Date: Thu, 13 Apr 2023 at 07:51
Subject: Inquiry oxygen sensor
To: <info@viamed-eu.com>
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Dear company

 

Could you send me a price  for 3Pcs Oxygen sensor Part number

0110017 Product name :

R-17MED Oxygen Sensor

GTIN / EAN13 5051826000700

 

Could you send shipping cost to Czech Republic as well.

 

Best Regards

 

Martin Satola

 

Company: Ing. Martin Satola

Motosin 216

75301 Hranice

Czech Republic

tel. +420 608 836 553

e-mail: satola@proat.cz

 

VAT: CZ8101165864

 

 

.
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SM-Purchase-Order-0001.pdf
9K
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