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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: VN202 with Quick-Ox Inquiry
1 message

Frankie Ho <frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com> 6 April 2023 at 01:05
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan,

Sorry for the late reply, it was holiday in Taiwan.

Address as follow,

1F, No.134, Xinshou St., Xinxing Dist. Kaohsiung City Taiwan R.O.C 80048

Fedex Account: 146600050

SCA Specialty Ltd.

Director

Frankie Ho 

TW +886 972 900 700 | CN +86 139 1048 0700 | HK +852 6640 0700 | 

| frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com

Confidentiality Notice: The information contained in this electronic mail message is intended for the use of the individual or entity named herein and contains
information that may be privileged, proprietary, confidential and exempt from disclosure. If the reader of this communication is not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error,
please contact the sender immediately.

On Mar 29, 2023, at 19:25, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Frankie

Please can you provide me with your complete delivery/invoice address and your FedEx account number. I will then reply with a proforma invoice. If
everything is okay, we can arrange a call and I can take your CC details over the phone.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 29 Mar 2023 at 11:35, Frankie Ho <frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

I would like to purchase a set pay by my credit card and use my Fedex account, please let me know how to proceed!

SCA Specialty Ltd.

Director

Frankie Ho 

TW +886 972 900 700 | CN +86 139 1048 0700 | HK +852 6640 0700 | 

| frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com

Confidentiality Notice: The information contained in this electronic mail message is intended for the use of the individual or entity named herein
and contains information that may be privileged, proprietary, confidential and exempt from disclosure. If the reader of this communication is not the
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this message in error, please contact the sender immediately.

On Mar 28, 2023, at 22:43, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
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﻿
Hi Frankie

I can't say exactly, but they are due to be ready and with us for the 14th April.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 28 Mar 2023 at 13:31, Frankie Ho <frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

Do you know when exactly?

SCA Specialty Ltd.

Director

Frankie Ho 

TW +886 972 900 700 | CN +86 139 1048 0700 | HK +852 6640 0700 | 

| frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com

Confidentiality Notice: The information contained in this electronic mail message is intended for the use of the individual or entity
named herein and contains information that may be privileged, proprietary, confidential and exempt from disclosure. If the reader
of this communication is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
message or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please contact the sender immediately.

On Mar 28, 2023, at 19:31, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

﻿
Hi Frankie

The Blue part is the Quick-Ox and is included in the price I gave you. 

The only issue is that we have recently had to have a new tool made to manufacture the Quick-Ox and so
production has been delayed for a while. The Quick-Ox is currently out of stock, but we expect to have them
available in the next couple of weeks.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 28 Mar 2023 at 11:44, Frankie Ho <frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

Last thing, please check the photo. The blue thing, is that include in the kit or extra? If extra, please quote me as
well.

SCA Specialty Ltd.

Director
Frankie Ho 
TW +886 972 900 700
| frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com

Confidentiality Notice: The information contained in this electronic mail message is intended for the use of the
individual or entity named herein and contains information that may be privileged, proprietary, confidential
and exempt from disclosure. If the reader of this communication is not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or its contents is strictly prohibited. If
you have received this message in error, please contact the sender immediately.
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On Mar 27, 2023, at 22:38, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Frankie
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1) 32x26x12cm, <1kg
2) Yes

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 27 Mar 2023 at 14:07, Frankie Ho <frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

I have 2 questions,

1. Can you please provide me the shipping box size/net weight/gross weight

2. If I have a Fedex account, can you ship by Fedex using my account?

Regards,

SCA Specialty Ltd.

Director
Frankie Ho 
TW +886 972 900 700
| frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com

Confidentiality Notice: The information contained in this electronic mail message is
intended for the use of the individual or entity named herein and contains information that
may be privileged, proprietary, confidential and exempt from disclosure. If the reader of
this communication is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or its contents is strictly prohibited. If
you have received this message in error, please contact the sender immediately.

On Mar 24, 2023, at 19:05, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Frankie

Thank you very much for your email.

VN202 with Quick Ox  = GBP £173
Airmail = GBP £15

If you would like to place an order, we can send you a proforma invoice or you can
do this on our website using a credit card.

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 24 Mar 2023 at 08:50, Frankie Ho <frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

I would like to get a quote for VN202 with Quick-Ox. 

Thank you!

SCA Specialty Ltd.

Director

Frankie Ho 

TW +886 972 900 700 | CN +86 139 1048 0700 | HK +852 6640 0700 | 

| frankie.ho@scaspecialty.com

Confidentiality Notice: The information contained in this electronic mail message
is intended for the use of the individual or entity named herein and contains
information that may be privileged, proprietary, confidential and exempt from
disclosure. If the reader of this communication is not the intended recipient, you
are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message
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or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error,
please contact the sender immediately.

<VN202 mkII Spec Sheet 2019-07-31 (email).pdf>


