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Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

RE: SOFIMAE_01RIS / : Commande d'Achats N° 6172 du 04/04/2023
1 message

Achats Sofimae <achats@sofimae.fr> 5 April 2023 at 08:52
To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Cc: relationclients@sofimae.fr

Good morning Mrs Lines

 

We are sorry to inform you that we cancel our order. The lead time is too long, we need those Oxygen
sensors urgently.

Thank you for your confirmation

 

Best regards

 

Cordialement.

 

 

Corinne DUPONT

Assistante Achats

50-52 avenue Paul Langevin - ZAC de l'Orme Pomponne

91130 RIS ORANGIS – France
Tél : +33 (0)1 69 02 88 72
achats@sofimae.fr

 

De : Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] De la part de Sophie Lines
Envoyé : mardi 4 avril 2023 16:53

mailto:achats@sofimae.fr
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
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À : Achats Sofimae
Objet : Re: SOFIMAE_01RIS / : Commande d'Achats N° 6172 du 04/04/2023

 

Good afternoon, 

 

Thank you for your order - please find attached your Proforma Invoice for the items requested. 

 

Please can you check I have all your details correct, and let me know if any changes are required?

 

If you are happy to go ahead, our bank details can be found on the Proforma Invoice - please be aware the
KE-25F3 Oxygen Sensor currently has a lead time of approximately 4-6 weeks, from receipt of payment.

 

If you require any further information please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the
main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or
call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------

 

 

On Tue, Apr 4, 2023 at 3:16 PM Achats Sofimae <achats@sofimae.fr> wrote:

Dear Mrs Lines,

Please find attached our purchase order n° 6172.

Could you confirm us your delivery lead time please ?

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:achats@sofimae.fr
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Thank you

Best regards

Le Service Achats – SOFIMAE

 

Laboratoire de Paris

ZAC de l’Orme Pomponne

50/52 Avenue Paul Langevin

91 130 RIS ORANGIS

Tél. +33 (0)1 69 02 88 72 - Fax. +33 (0)1 69 02 88 69

E-mail : achats@sofimae.fr

 

mailto:achats@sofimae.fr

