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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

CM - Purchase Order OCI 003 2023 updated - Attached
1 message

admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe <admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe> 30 March 2023 at 16:26
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Cc: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>, admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe

Dear Ryan Swaine,

 

Many thanks for your kind answer. We updated the PO OCI 003 2023. Here is attached.

Notice that we also consider your bank information for the transference.

Our data:

Clinic Medic Equipment SAC

RUC (Peruvian Tax ID): 20518384083

Address: Jr. Teodoro Cardenas 256. Lima Cercado. Lima. PERU.

ZIP Code: 15046

Telephone: +51 962767433 / 962767434

Email: admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe

Please confirm the Purchase order, so we could order the transference.

 

I Will be waiting for your kind support.

 

Have a great day,

 

Isabel  Teodoro Machuca

Clinic Medic Equipment SAC

Jr. Teodoro Cárdenas 256, Lima Cercado. Lima - PERU.

Email: admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe

Móvil: 51-962767434  / 962767433 (Whatsapp)

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Kate Griffiths
Enviado el: jueves, 30 de marzo de 2023 05:29
Para: admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe
CC: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Asunto: Re: CM - Purchase Order OCI 003 2023 - UFO Sensors

 

Good morning Isabel,
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Please see attached proforma invoice.  You will see that the correct price is $166.50 each.

 

Please could you let me know if you require any changes to be made, eg addresses - do you have a postcode/zip
code I could use please?

 

I am unable to give you serial numbers yet as I do not know which items the warehouse would pick if you proceed
with your order.

 

The proforma invoice is valid for 30 days.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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On Thu, 30 Mar 2023 at 10:59, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe>
Date: Wed, 29 Mar 2023 at 17:33
Subject: CM - Purchase Order OCI 003 2023 - UFO Sensors
To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: <admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe>

 

Dear Ryan Swaine,

 

Many thanks for your kind support, we are writting from our new email address.

 

Here is our Purchase order OCI 003 2023 about UFO sensors.

 

The purchase order has all our data:

Clinic Medic Equipment SAC

RUC (Peruvian Tax ID): 20518384083

Address: Jr. Teodoro Cardenas 256. Lima Cercado. Lima. PERU.

Telephone: +51 962767433 / 962767434

Email: admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe

 

Please quote the Air Freight in the cheaper way: Fedex, UPS or DHL.

I guess the option is international economy.

 

We need the bank information of VIAMED in order to make the proper transference, please your help with this too.

 

Isabel  Teodoro Machuca

Clinic Medic Equipment SAC

Jr. Teodoro Cárdenas 256, Lima Cercado. Lima - PERU.

Email: admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe

Móvil: 51-962767434  / 962767433 (Whatsapp)

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine
Enviado el: martes, 25 de octubre de 2022 10:51
Para: administracion1@clinicmedic.com.pe
Asunto: Re: CME - We would like to work directly with you in PERU

 

Dear Isabel
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Thank you very much for your email. We would be happy to work with you directly and offer you our distributor
pricing. Please find the information below:

 

UFO130-2 Oxygen sensor - pn 0110081 = USD $131.50 each EXW

 

If you would like to proceed with an order, please supply your complete delivery address and invoice address if
different. We will provide you with a proforma invoice, we currently have stock available from our warehouse in the
UK.

 

I look forward to your response and please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

 

Kind regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

Viamed are pleased to be exhibiting at Medica

14th to 17th November 2022

Hall 16 / H-15-4

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

Isabel  Teodoro Machuca

Clinic Medic Equipment SAC

Jr. Teodoro Cárdenas 256, Lima Cercado. Lima - PERU.

Email: admin1@clinicmedic.com.pe

Móvil: 51-962767434  / 962767433 (Whatsapp)
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