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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser
1 message

magasin@plongequilibre.com <magasin@plongequilibre.com> 23 March 2023 at 17:15
To: ATELIER PLONGEQUILIBRE <atelier@plongequilibre.com>, office@viamed.co.uk, ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Dear Ryan,

 

Thanks for your answer. We will place this order :

7910101 x3

7910201 x3

 

The billing address and shipping address are the same :

PLONGEQUILIBRE

84 rue du rocher

75008 Paris (France)

VAT number FR63501551709

 

Please make me a proforma invoice and send me your informations for a bank transfer.

 

Best regards

Jérôme

 

PLONGEQUILIBRE

84 rue du rocher 75008 Paris

Ouvert du lundi au samedi de 10h à 19h

Tel : 01.42.94.98.41

Site : www.boutiqueplongequilibre.com

 

-------- Message transféré --------

Sujet :Re: VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser

Date :Thu, 23 Mar 2023 13:01:33 +0000

De :Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
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Répondre à :ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Pour :ATELIER PLONGEQUILIBRE <atelier@plongequilibre.com>

 

Dear Atelier

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

We would be happy to supply you directly at our trade pricing. Please find our trade and retail price lists attached, I
have also attached some product information.

 

Please can you provide me with your invoice/delivery address, company VAT number and the contact information for
the persons responsible for accounts, purchasing and ownership of the company?

 

You can place an order whenever you are ready, we do not impose any minimum order quantities, we would only ask
that your initial orders are prepaid by either bank transfer or credit card.

 

I look forward to hearing from you and please never hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

 

Kind regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Thu, 23 Mar 2023 at 10:40, ATELIER PLONGEQUILIBRE <atelier@plongequilibre.com> wrote:

Hello

we are  dive shop in Paris (France).

Is it possible to order directly to your cie ? Or do you have a distributor in France ?

We are interested by O2 Analyser (VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser) and eventually by O2 cells.

Do you have a professional rate ?

Thank you very much for your anwer.
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Best regards

 

--
Atelier Plongequilibre
ouverture du lundi au vendredi de 10h à 19h
5 rue Larribe 75008 PARIS
09 87 59 54 50
www.atelier-plongequilibre.fr
www.boutiqueplongequilibre.com
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