23/03/2023, 12:43 Gmail - Fwd: Item request

M Gma” Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>

Fwd: Item request

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 23 March 2023 at 12:10
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqgib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill
<janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Please can we send them a proforma invoice.

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: <office@esomedsolution.ro>
Date: Thu, 23 Mar 2023 at 10:43
Subject: RE: Item request

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Ref:R300P01, regular 33-38cm

thanks

Emil Popescu
0768-347077

Esomed Solution Srl
Rusciorului, Nr. 21
550112-Sibiu, Romania

=SON'=D
SOLUTION

Engineering the Future

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2023 12:39 PM

To: office@esomedsolution.ro

Subject: Re: Item request

Dear Emil

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6321039d91&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1761160422608304084 &simpl=msg-f:1761160422608... 1/3


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:office@esomedsolution.ro
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:office@esomedsolution.ro

23/03/2023, 12:43 Gmail - Fwd: Item request
Thank you, please can you let us know which size of mask you require?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 23 Mar 2023 at 10:36, <office@esomedsolution.ro> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Please send me 1 piece MAX-250(B) — 0110432
EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask 320 pieces

Best regards

Emil Popescu
0768-347077

Esomed Solution Srl
Rusciorului, Nr. 21
550112-Sibiu, Romania

=SON'=D
SOLUTION

Engineering the Future

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, March 13, 2023 5:16 PM

To: Emil Popescu <office@esomedsolution.ro>

Subject: Re: Item request

Hi Emil

Thank you very much for your inquiry.
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| believe the PSR-11-75- KES is for the SLE vents and has a 3 pole connector. We supply the original MAX-250(B)
sensor and we can supply the connector, but we are unable to put the two together. If you or your client would like
to do this we can supply the parts, but you will need to use a soldering iron:

MAX-250(B) - 0110432 = EUR €57.30

3 pole connector - 0131527 = EUR €4.65

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 9 Mar 2023 at 19:52, Emil Popescu <office@esomedsolution.ro> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Please tell me if you can deliver Analystical Industries® PSR-11-75- KE8 O2 sensors? If so please send me
price and lead time.

Best regards.

Emil Popescu
0768-347077
Esomed Solution Srl
Rusciorului, Nr. 21

550112-Sibiu, Romania
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