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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Urgent inquiry
1 message

Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com> 20 March 2023 at 11:24
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

Please note the PayPal address is different from the billing and delivery address.

The billing and delivery address is as mentioned below:

P.O BOX 30198,3RD FLOOR
BUILDING 2304, ROAD 2830
AL SEEF, MANAMA
KINGDOM OF BAHRAIN

Regards,
 
Divya Sharma
Product Specialist
Mob:  +973 – 33629448
Tel:      +973 - 17112344
Fax:     +973 - 17583324
Web:   www.navigamedical.com
 

From: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>
Sent: Monday, March 20, 2023 2:04 PM
To: Jish Jacob <jish.jacob@woodserv.com>
Subject: Fw: Urgent inquiry
 
fyi

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, March 20, 2023 2:02 PM
To: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>
Subject: Re: Urgent inquiry
 
Good morning Divya,

Thank you for your payment.

Just to clarify, the delivery address on the PayPal email is different to that on the proforma invoice.  The PayPal address is as
follows:

https://urldefense.com/v3/__http:/www.navigamedical.com__;!!KHGsRxShrw!qxJHVUVFOEUmJ-MXEHDBAQQLRfq4qKWWz0Z3jUL1L4hBU9QCGwe6t0DvIfkCw0Vdsrg$
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Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the
main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on
it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Mon, 20 Mar 2023 at 07:28, Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com> wrote:
Hello Kate,

Please find attached the payment receipt.

Kindly dispatch the item as soon as possible.

Regards,
 
Divya Sharma
Product Specialist
Mob:  +973 – 33629448
Tel:      +973 - 17112344
Fax:     +973 - 17583324
Web:   www.navigamedical.com
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From: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>
Sent: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 11:35 AM
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: Re: Urgent inquiry
 
Hello Kate,

The order is confirmed. Kindly arrange the items.
We will send you the payment asap.

Regards,
 
Divya Sharma
Product Specialist
Mob      :  +973 – 33629448
Tel:       :  +973 - 17112344
Fax:         :  +973 - 17583324
Web:       : www.navigamedical.com
 

From: Divya Chandran
Sent: Tuesday, March 14, 2023 8:45 AM
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: RE: Urgent inquiry
 
Hi kate,
 
We are waiting for the end user reply. Hopefully I can get the positive response this week. If any changes I will let you
know.
 
Thankyou.
 
From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Monday, March 13, 2023 4:42 PM
To: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>
Subject: Re: Urgent inquiry
 
Good afternoon Divya,
 
I hope you are well.
 
Just a quick email to ask if MVM142090 is still required.  It expires on March 26th, at that time it will be not be able to be
used for payment.
 
Many thanks.

Kind regards
 
Kate Griffiths
 
Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
 
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
 
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
 
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
 
E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
 
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
 
 
On Thu, 23 Feb 2023 at 14:26, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Divya,
 
Thank you for your order.
 
Please see attached proforma invoice, valid for 30 days.  Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.
 
I have used the following addresses, and also used PayPal as your last order was paid that way.
 

 
The warranty is 15 months.  This sensor is currently in stock.
 
Many thanks.

Kind regards
 
Kate Griffiths
 
Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
 
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
 
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
 
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
 
E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
 
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
 
 
On Thu, 23 Feb 2023 at 11:57, Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com> wrote:

Hello Team,
Good day!
 
 
We have an inquiry for

The closing date of inquiry is27,Monday,February. Please provide a quote before that.
Kindly quote us your most competitive price for the above-mentioned item, along with the shortest date of delivery,
shipping charges, and warranty if this comes under your product range.
 
I hope to have an early response from you.
 
Best regards,
 
Divya Sharma
Product Specialist
Mob      :  +973 – 33629448
Tel:       :  +973 - 17112344
Fax:         :  +973 - 17583324
Web:       : www.navigamedical.com
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