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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: New customer message on 7 March 2023 at 15:03
1 message

Duttons Divers <duttonsdivers@gmail.com> 17 March 2023 at 19:55
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hiya Ryan, 

Please can I order 2 of these. 

VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser (inc. Sensor) - Auto switch-off 

Thanks, 

Clare

On Tue, Mar 14, 2023 at 3:32 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Clare

Thank you very much. 
Please find our trade and retail price lists attached. 

We do not impose any minimum order quantities and you are free to order as soon as you wish, but we would ask
that your orders are prepaid, at least for the first few orders. Payment can be made by bank transfer or credit card.

Please  just let me know if you have any questions or concerns.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 14 Mar 2023 at 14:52, Duttons Divers <duttonsdivers@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

Thanks for your reply. That’s great. 

We are a dive chain based in North wales. We operate 3 dive centres and 2 boats. With 8 staff. The directors are
myself and Jean. 

Our business telephone number is: 07375 113576

Address: Hafan marina dive centre, hafan marina workshops, unit 6, Pwllheli, LL535YT. This would be for invoice
and delivery.

Our company number I will need to send when I am in the office later. 

Please let me know if you need anything else.

Thanks,

Clare 

On Tue, 14 Mar 2023 at 10:27, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Clare
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Thank you very much for your message and I am very sorry for the late reply.

We would be happy to supply you on a trade basis. Before I send on our prices, please can you provide me
with a bit of information regarding your company; the Directors and responsible people, contact information,
company registration number and delivery/invoice address?

I look forward to hearing from you.

Thank you and best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 7 Mar 2023 at 15:03, Vandagraph (Shopify) <mailer@shopify.com> wrote:

You received a new message from your online store's contact form.

Country Code:
GB

Name:
Clare Dutton

Email:
duttonsdivers@gmail.com

Phone Number:
07590075909

Message:
Hi, We are a scuba diving chain and looking to sell nitrox analysers to
our customers. Would it be possible for us to have an account to do
this?

Thanks,

Clare

--
Clare Dutton
PADI Course Director, 355449
Director of Duttons divers

Mobile: 07375 113576
Website: https://www.duttonsdivers.com/

     
Learn. Travel. Protect. Enjoy
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Finance available      

--
Clare Dutton
PADI Course Director, 355449
Director of Duttons divers

Mobile: 07375 113576
Website: https://www.duttonsdivers.com/

     
Learn. Travel. Protect. Enjoy

Finance available      
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