17/03/2023, 11:23 Gmail - RE: Price offer request Viamed

M Gmall Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

RE: Price offer request Viamed
1 message

Denitza Radkova <denitza.radkova@medilon.bg> 17 March 2023 at 09:36
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

Please, remove the insurance and confirm for us if we are to make prepayment for this order.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Denitza Radkova
Sales and Marketing Assistant

Order processing

MEDILON EOOD
98 "Bulgaria" blvd.
ASTRA Business center, entr.D, office 4D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 958 9787

fax: (+359 2) 958 9767

mobile: (+359) 888 130 536

E-mail: denitza.radkova@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Thursday, March 16, 2023 5:52 PM

To: Denitza Radkova

Subject: Re: Price offer request Viamed

Good afternoon Denitza,

Thank you for your order.

Please see attached proforma invoice, valid for 30 days. The items are currently in stock. Please let me know if you
require any changes to be made.

We have recently had a change to our insurance policy. You will see that the insurance line for your order is $12.50,
this is the minimum insurance we now charge. Please let me know if you would like me to remove this line - you
would then assume the risk and responsibility for the goods from the time they leave Viamed until they
reach you.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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17/03/2023, 11:23 Gmail - RE: Price offer request Viamed
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 16 Mar 2023 at 13:57, Denitza Radkova <denitza.radkova@medilon.bg> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Please, find attached our order 2023014.

Please, confirm our order and estimated delivery time.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Denitza Radkova
Sales and Marketing Assistant

Order processing

MEDILON EOOD
98 "Bulgaria" blvd.
ASTRA Business center, entr.D, office 4D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 958 9787

fax: (+359 2) 958 9767

mobile: (+359) 888 130 536

E-mail: denitza.radkova@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2023 3:43 PM

To: nina.arsenova@medilon.bg

Cc: Denitza Radkova

Subject: Re: Price offer request Viamed

Good afternoon Nina,
Thank you for our enquiry.

The price breaks for part number 0110017 - R-17MED are as follows:
1-24 = $ 47.90 25 or more = $ 43.10 each EXW

| have attached a price list.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 22 Feb 2023 at 13:34, <nina.arsenova@medilon.bg> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Would you please confirm the price for 0110017 R-17MED: 7-13mV O2 sensor - $34.50 EXW?

Thanks and best regards,

Nina

Nina Bahtarlieva

Sales & Marketing Assistant
Quality Manager

MEDILON EOOD

98 "Bulgaria" bivd.

Business center ASTRA, office 4D, entr.D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 9589787

fax: (+359 2) 9589767

mobile: (+359) 885 161 091

E-mail: nina.arsenova@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg
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From: nina.arsenova@medilon.bg <nina.arsenova@medilon.bg>
Sent: Wednesday, December 21, 2022 12:55 PM

To: 'kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk' <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: 'Denitza Radkova' <denitza.radkova@medilon.bg>

Subject: RE: Price offer request Viamed

Dear Kate,

Thank you for the confirmation!

Have nice and safe holidays @)!

Best regards,

Nina

Nina Bahtarlieva

Sales & Marketing Assistant
Quality Manager

MEDILON EOOD

98 "Bulgaria" bivd.

Business center ASTRA, office 4D, entr.D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 9589787

fax: (+359 2) 9589767

mobile: (+359) 885 161 091

E-mail: nina.arsenova@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg
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17/03/2023, 11:23 Gmail - RE: Price offer request Viamed

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Wednesday, December 21, 2022 12:36 PM

To: nina.arsenova@medilon.bg

Subject: Re: Price offer request Viamed

Hi Nina,

The price will remain the same, you are fine to use the $40 price in the new year. Our office will re-open on
January 3rd after the Christmas holiday.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Wed, 21 Dec 2022 at 10:33, <nina.arsenova@medilon.bg> wrote:

Thank you, Kate!

Are you going to have price increase from 01.01.20237? I'm asking because | am not sure if we would place
an order until 31.12.2022.

Best regards,

Nina

Nina Bahtarlieva

Sales & Marketing Assistant
Quality Manager

MEDILON EOOD

98 "Bulgaria" bivd.

Business center ASTRA, office 4D, entr.D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 9589787

fax: (+359 2) 9589767

mobile: (+359) 885 161 091

E-mail: nina.arsenova@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Wednesday, December 21, 2022 12:24 PM

To: nina.arsenova@medilon.bg

Subject: Re: Price offer request Viamed

Good morning Nina,
Thank you for your enquiry.

The price of part number 0110045 oxygen sensor R-45V is $40.00 each EXW.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1752817046249819326%7Cmsg-f:176060720386730... 8/23


https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=nina.arsenova@medilon.bg
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=nina.arsenova@medilon.bg
http://www.medilon.bg/
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=viamedinbox@gmail.com
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=nina.arsenova@medilon.bg

17/03/2023, 11:23 Gmail - RE: Price offer request Viamed
This item is currently in stock.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 21 Dec 2022 at 09:56, <nina.arsenova@medilon.bg> wrote:
Dear Kate,
Would you please confirm the price for the following?:
0110045 Viamed Oxygen Sensor R-45V

Thank you in advance!

Nina Bahtarlieva
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Sales & Marketing Assistant

Quality Manager

MEDILON EOOD

98 "Bulgaria" blvd.

Business center ASTRA, office 4D, entr.D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 9589787

fax: (+359 2) 9589767

mobile: (+359) 885 161 091
E-mail: nina.arsenova@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg

YNedilon | 2O

From: Denitza Radkova <denitza.radkova@medilon.bg>
Sent: Monday, May 30, 2022 3:11 PM

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Cc: 'Nina Arsenova' <nina.arsenova@medilon.bg>
Subject: RE: Price offer request Viamed

Dear Kate,
Please, find attached our revised order 2022053REV.
Please, confirm our order and estimated delivery time.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Denitza Radkova
Sales and Marketing Assistant

Order processing
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MEDILON EOOD
98 "Bulgaria" blvd.
ASTRA Business center, entr.D, office 4D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 958 9787

fax: (+359 2) 958 9767

mobile: (+359) 888 130 536

E-mail: denitza.radkova@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg
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From: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg [mailto:boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg]
Sent: Monday, April 11, 2022 5:09 PM

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Cc: 'Nina Arsenova'; daniela.jeliazkova@medilon.bg

Subject: RE: Price offer request Viamed

Hello Kate,

We are still waiting for a confirmation for another product for our client so | will send you an email when we
have more information about the Order.

Kind regards,
Boryana

Boryana Vicheva
Sales and Marketing Assistant

Order processing

MEDILON EOOD
98 "Bulgaria" blvd.
ASTRA Business center, entr.D, office 4D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 958 9787
fax: (+359 2) 958 9767

mobile: (+359) 888 130 536
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d 1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1752817046249819326%7Cmsg-f:17606072038673...
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E-mail: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg

YNedilon 20

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Monday, April 11, 2022 4:48 PM

To: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg

Cc: daniela.jeliazkova@medilon.bg; nina.arsenova@medilon.bg

Subject: Re: Price offer request Viamed

Good afternoon Boryana,
| hope you are well.

Please could | ask if proforma invoice MVM136205 is still required? Please let me know if | can be of any
further assistance.

Many thanks
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered
remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 31 Mar 2022 at 11:39, Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Boryana,

Thank you for your order.

Please see attached proforma invoice, please let me know if you require any changes to be made. The
proforma invoice is valid for 30 days.

This item is currently in stock so we should be able to ship as soon as your payment is received.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered
remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 31 Mar 2022 at 10:03, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg>

Date: Thu, 31 Mar 2022 at 09:59

Subject: RE: Price offer request Viamed

To: <daniela.jeliazkova@medilon.bg>, Nina Arsenova <nina.arsenova@medilon.bg>,
<orders@viamed.co.uk>

Hello ,

Please, find attached our order 2022053.

Please, confirm our order and estimated delivery time.

Kind regards ,

Boryana

Kinds regards ,

Boryana
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Kind regards,

Boryana Vicheva
Sales and Marketing Assistant

Order processing

MEDILON EOOD
98 "Bulgaria" blvd.
ASTRA Business center, entr.D, office 4D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 958 9787

fax: (+359 2) 958 9767

mobile: (+359) 888 130 536

E-mail: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg
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From: Nina Arsenova [mailto:nina.arsenova@medilon.bg]
Sent: Tuesday, March 29, 2022 4:51 PM

To: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg

Subject: RE: Price offer request

ok

From: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg [mailto:boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg]

Sent: Tuesday, March 29, 2022 4:35 PM
To: 'Nina Arsenova'
Subject: FW: Price offer request

3apasen HuHa,

Mons pa npoeepka Ha ORDER2022053.

Mo3gpasn,
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BopsiHa

Kind regards,

Boryana Vicheva
Sales and Marketing Assistant

Order processing

MEDILON EOOD
98 "Bulgaria" blvd.
ASTRA Business center, entr.D, office 4D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 958 9787

fax: (+359 2) 958 9767

mobile: (+359) 888 130 536

E-mail: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg

www.medilon.bg
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From: Nina Arsenova [mailto:nina.arsenova@medilon.bg]
Sent: Tuesday, March 29, 2022 3:57 PM

To: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg

Subject: FW: Price offer request

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: Friday, March 18, 2022 9:54 AM

To: Nina Arsenova

Cc: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg; Daniela Jeliazkova
Subject: Re: Price offer request

Dear Nina,

The currency on your account is Dollars, so the unit price for the R-17MED is $34.50 EXW.

Apologies for the confusion.
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Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 18 Mar 2022 at 07:50, Nina Arsenova <nina.arsenova@medilon.bg> wrote:

Dear Sarah,

Please confirm if the currency is USD or EUR.
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17/03/2023, 11:23 Gmail - RE: Price offer request Viamed

Kind regards,

Nina

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: Friday, March 18, 2022 9:29 AM

To: Nina Bahtarlieva

Cc: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg; Daniela Jeliazkova; Denitza Radkova

Subject: Re: Price offer request

Apologies Nina, the unit price is $34.50 EXW.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@yviamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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17/03/2023, 11:23 Gmail - RE: Price offer request Viamed

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 18 Mar 2022 at 07:25, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Nina,

Hope that you are well.

The unit price for the R-17MED is €32.00 EXW.

| would just like to inform you that | will be leaving Viamed on the 31st of March to pursue a
different career path. It has been a pleasure working with you all over these last few years.

For any orders or queries after the 31st of March, please can you email orders@viamed.co.uk

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still
be answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 18 Mar 2022 at 07:19, Nina Arsenova <nina.arsenova@medilon.bg> wrote:

Dear Sarah,

Would you please confirm the price for the following?:

R-17MED (0110017)

Thank you in advance!

Best regards,

Nina

Nina Bahtarlieva
Sales & Marketing Assistant

Quality Manager

MEDILON EOOD
98 "Bulgaria" blvd.
Business center ASTRA, office 4D, entr.D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 9589787
fax: (+359 2) 9589767

mobile: (+359) 885 161 091

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1752817046249819326%7Cmsg-f:17606072038673...
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E-mail: nina.arsenova@medilon.bg
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: Wednesday, February 16, 2022 3:45 PM

To: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg

Cc: Nina Bahtarlieva; Daniela Jeliazkova

Subject: Re: Price offer request

Good Afternoon,
Please accept my reply.

The R-43V sensor pack of 2, part number 0110043 is $87.50 EXW and we do have stock
available.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will
still be answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken
or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg>

Date: Wed, 16 Feb 2022 at 13:33
Subject: Price offer request
To: <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Cc: Nina Arsenova <nina.arsenova@medilon.bg>, <daniela.jeliazkova@medilon.bg>

Dear Ryan,

Could you please confirm if you offer and what is the price and availability of the following:

110043 R-43V Oxygen Sensor

Thank you in advance,

Kind regards,

Boryana Vicheva
Sales and Marketing Assistant

Order processing

MEDILON EOOD
98 "Bulgaria" blvd.
ASTRA Business center, entr.D, office 4D

1680 Sofia, Bulgaria

tel.: (+359 2) 958 9787

fax: (+359 2) 958 9767
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mobile: (+359) 888 130 536
E-mail: boryana.vicheva@medilon.bg
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