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M G ma|l Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Warranty claim
2 messages

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> 16 March 2023 at 12:29
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

Thank you for your for information for MySign oxygen monitor, will send quotation to client,for get the
approval

Stocks are available with an R-49V oxygen sensor? need order 10 Pcs, can you send a proforma invoice
please

Completed the pending payments for RVM141843,already informed to account director
Need settle GBP-655.08 for only RVM142217, we will arrange this immediately,

Thanks & regards,
Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Thu, Mar 16, 2023 at 5:22 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Sudath,

Thank you for your email.
The price of part number 0111276 - oxygen monitor MySign O is £277.60 each EXW.

The following is the information | can see about the charger (charger is included when you buy the
MySign O Oxygen Monitor Kit):

Charger Protection Class I, Input: AC 110V - 230V / 50 - 60 Hz, Qutput: DC 1.5 A
Charge time Approximately 4 hours

| have attached the leaflet. If this does not answer your question about the charger, | can ask Ryan
Swaine. Please also see attached price list.

| will create your proforma very soon and email it to you separately.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 16 Mar 2023 at 10:52, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Good Morning Kate,

Available R-49V Oxygen sensor? need order 10 Pcs, please send the proforma invoice

Need to get the price for MySign Oxygen Monitor (011276) ? Does it work with the main supply (220v
) With power pack?

Thanks & regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Mar 10, 2023 at 8:56 PM Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Sudath,

The warehouse have now received the correct AWB and | believe that your courier will collect on
Monday. We will of course email you the delivery note and invoice as soon as the goods leave our
warehouse.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.
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