16/03/2023, 10:26 Gmail - Re: Order EB-230416

On Tue, 14 Mar 2023 at 10:12, Jara Bareiss <Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com> wrote:

Hello

Its ok, please send all what you have now.

Kind regards,

Jara Bareiss
OrderLine Administration
Phone +41 52 646 03 14 (direct)

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Agib Majeed
Gesendet: Dienstag, 14. Marz 2023 11:11

An: Jara Bareiss <Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com>

Betreff: Re: Order EB-230416

Hello

Good morning

The current cost of carriage for this order is €23.20.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
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Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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16/03/2023, 10:26 Gmail - Re: Order EB-230416
On Tue, 14 Mar 2023 at 10:08, Jara Bareiss <Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com> wrote:

Dear Aqib

How high are the shipping charges?

Best regards

Jara Bareiss
OrderLine Administration
Phone +41 52 646 03 14 (direct)

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Aqib Majeed
Gesendet: Dienstag, 14. Marz 2023 10:19

An: Jara Bareiss <Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com>

Betreff: Re: Order EB-230416

Hello Jara

Good morning

If you would like we can part ship some of this order but bare in mind you will have to pay the shipping charges twice.

Please let me know what you would like to do.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
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16/03/2023, 10:26 Gmail - Re: Order EB-230416
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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16/03/2023, 10:26 Gmail - Re: Order EB-230416

On Mon, 13 Mar 2023 at 14:35, Jara Bareiss <Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com> wrote:

Ok and if you can to a part delivery, please do this!

Thank you

Jara Bareiss
OrderLine Administration
Phone +41 52 646 03 14 (direct)

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Aqib Majeed
Gesendet: Montag, 13. Marz 2023 15:02

An: Jara Bareiss <Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com>

Betreff: Re: Order EB-230416

Hello

Good afternoon

As soon as we have the item back in stock we will make you aware before we dispatch your order.

Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered,
but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 13 Mar 2023 at 13:59, Jara Bareiss <Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com> wrote:
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16/03/2023, 10:26 Gmail - Re: Order EB-230416
Hello

We need exactly this item.

Please just send us the 50 pieces as soon as possible.

Thank you very much.

Best regards

Jara Bareiss
OrderLine Administration
Phone +41 52 646 03 14 (direct)

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Agib Majeed
Gesendet: Montag, 13. Marz 2023 12:27

An: Jara Bareiss <Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com>

Betreff: Re: Order EB-230416

Hello

Good morning

| need to advise you we have roughly a lead time of 2-3 weeks for more stock to arrive on the 0110043.

Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.
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Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Gmail - Re: Order EB-230416

On Tue, 7 Mar 2023 at 16:42, Aqgib Majeed <aqib.majeed@yviamed.co.uk> wrote:

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-a:r3002114733052697000&simpl=msg-a:r3002114733052697000&mb=1

Hello

Good afternoon

Thank you for your order, EB-230416.

| will go ahead and process this now.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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16/03/2023, 10:26 Gmail - Re: Order EB-230416

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 7 Mar 2023 at 16:06, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jara Bareiss <Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com>

Date: Tue, 7 Mar 2023 at 15:54

Subject: Order EB-230416

To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@yviamed.co.uk>
Cc: Matthias Storrer <Matthias.Storrer@anandic.com>
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16/03/2023, 10:26

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-a:r3002114733052697000&simpl=msg-a:r3002114733052697000&mb=1

Dear all,

Attached you will find our new order ref.: EB-230416.
Please send us your order acknowledgement within 3 days including information on expected delivery date. Thank you.

Best regards

Jara Bareiss
OrderLine Administration

Gmail - Re: Order EB-230416

Anandic Medical Systems AG
Feuerthalen ZH | Burgdorf | Lausanne

Stadtweg 24, CH-8245 Feuerthalen
Phone +41 848 800 900

Phone +41 52 646 03 14 (direct)
Fax +41 848 845 855

Jara.Bareiss@anandic.com
www.anandic.healthcare

People who healthcare.
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