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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Viamed Item to bring forward 2023.03.15
1 message

Steve Hardaker <office@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk
To: office@vmsecure.me.uk

Hi all,

Just for reference at this stage, TAP want to bring their order forward, I have advised that we are still awaiting a revised PO at the correct price. 

Steve H

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Steve Hardaker <steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Wed, 15 Mar 2023 at 17:03
Subject: Re: Viamed Item to bring forward 2023.03.15
To: Powell, Erica <Erica.Powell@sartorius.com>

Hi Erica,

This will be no problem at all as we have sufficient sensors in stock. However, please can I draw your attention to the email below from the 10th March regarding the p

Please could I ask you to send an amended order with the revised price and due date, and with a line for 'Shipping Insurance' @ £50.00+VAT or a statement declaring

Please be aware that without shipping insurance, losses during transit will be at your own risk.

Once we receive that, I will have the order amended on our system and scheduled for delivery.

Best Regards,

Steve Hardaker
Technical Support Manager
Viamed Ltd.

---------------------------------

Hi Erica,

Thank you for the order. We note the due date of 21st April 2023 and will deliver in full on that date.

I just need to make you aware that a price increase was notified on 1st February of this year: the price for a minimum order quantity of 100 units in a single order is no

Viamed’s pricing is EXW (Ex-Works) Incoterms 2020. We now offer optional shipping insurance to distributors placing orders. Viamed’s standard shipping service is via U
or damage once it leaves Viamed's premises over the shipment value of £60.

If you wish to upgrade the shipping to CIP (Carriage and Insurance Paid), please add an additional line to the order as 'Shipping Insurance', which at 1% of the total p

If you wish to go ahead with the order, please could I ask you to amend and resend?  Thanks in advance and I look forward to hearing from you.

Best Regards,

Steve Hardaker
Technical Support Manager
Viamed Ltd.
Please note:  Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue

Website: www.viamed.co.uk
email: steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd 
Facebook: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 
Company registered in England, No. 1291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

------------------
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Hi

 

We have an order we would like to bring forward if at all possible:

 

Vendor(from
Purchasing
Document)

Vendor name Purchasing
Document

Material Material Description Vendor Material Number Item Order
Quant

999185 VIAMED LIMITED 4561196977 S-0262 SENSOR,OXYGEN,MAX-250B_ MAX-250B R125P02-003 10 100

 

Please could you let us know whether you can or cannot help us?

 

 

 

Best Regards | Freundlichen Grüßen

Erica Powell
Manufacturing Engineering Buyer
Mental Health First Aider
Supply Chain Management

Phone +44 1763 227200
Hotline +44 1763 227250
www.sartorius.com

The Automation Partnership (Cambridge) Ltd.
Registered in England and Wales No. 02823205
Grantham Close
York Way
Royston, Hertfordshire SG8 5WY
 

http://www.sartorius.com/

