15/03/2023, 14:07 Gmail - RE: PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd.

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd.

1 message

Kushagra Shukla | 3T Worldwide <kushagra.shukla@3tworldwide.com> 15 March 2023 at 13:09
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, "viamedinbox@gmail.com" <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Cc: "viamedinbox@gmail.com" <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, Denzil George | 3T Worldwide
<denzil.george@3tworldwide.com>, Mohammad Imran | 3T Worldwide <mohammad.imran@3tworldwide.com>, Paulsy Paul |

3T Worldwide <paulsy.paul@3tworldwide.com>, Ashish Vishnu | Three T Worldwide Global Trading WLL
<ashish.vishnu@3tworldwide.com>

Dear Kate,

I am requesting you to share the ProForma Invoice for certifications that we asked.

Thanks & Regards,

Kushagra Shukla

3T GROUP

3T Worldwide Angola — Engenharia.

3T Worldwide Mo¢ambique, Lda 3T Oil and Gas Services LL.C g g Lda
Torres Rani, Avenida Marginal, Talhdo 141, 701 Tillery Street, Suite 12, Rua Dr Jose Pereira do Nascimento No 37

6° andar, PO BOX 96, Maputo, Mai Luand
Mogambique Austin, TX 78702, alanga, Luanda
USA Angola

Mob: +1-512-675-4715 +1-512-675-4715, +1-800-220-

0P TR e0 T 2348 x 4715 Mob: +1-512-675-4715

Quali L'y | Reliabili L'y | Integri Ty

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL: This Disclaimer is covered by the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. §§ 2510-2521. This communication may contain information that is proprietary, privileged,
and confidential or otherwise legally protected from disclosure, and is intended to be received and read only by certain individuals. If it has been misdirected, or if you suspect you have received this in error, you are not
authorized to read, print, retain copy or disseminate this message or any part of it. Delivery of this message or any portions herein to any person other than the intended recipient is not intended to waive any right or

privilege. Please notify sender immediately and delete all copies of the message and its attachments

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 6:35 PM

To: Kushagra Shukla | 3T Worldwide <kushagra.shukla@3tworldwide.com>

Cc: viamedinbox@gmail.com; Denzil George | 3T Worldwide <denzil.george@3tworldwide.com>; Mohammad Imran | 3T
Worldwide <mohammad.imran@3tworldwide.com>; Paulsy Paul | 3T Worldwide <paulsy.paul@3tworldwide.com>; Ashish
Vishnu | Three T Worldwide Global Trading WLL <ashish.vishnu@3tworldwide.com>

Subject: Re: PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd.
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15/03/2023, 14:07 Gmail - RE: PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd.

Thank you for your email, you have already paid for the goods (March 13th), but please see attached invoice in case this is
what you require.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to
the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in
the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 15 Mar 2023 at 12:57, Kushagra Shukla | 3T Worldwide <kushagra.shukla@3tworldwide.com> wrote:

Hello Kate,

Below email is acknowledged, please share the Invoice for same so that we can make the payment.

Please treat urgent.
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15/03/2023, 14:07 Gmail - RE: PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd.

Thanks & Regards,

Kushagra Shukla

3T GROUP

3T Worldwide Angola — Engenharia.
3T Worldwide Mo¢ambique, Lda 3T Oil and Gas Services LLC g g Lda
Torres Rani, Avenida Marginal, Talhdo 141, 701 Tillery Street, Suite 12, Rua Dr Jose Pereira do Nascimento No 37

6° andar, PO BOX 96, Maputo, Mai Luand
Mogambique Austin, TX 78702, alanga, Luanda
USA Angola

Mob: +1-512-6754715 +1-512-675-4715, +1-800-220-

Op: TR Eh 2348 x 4715 Mob: +1-512-675-4715
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PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL: This Disclaimer is covered by the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. §§ 2510-2521. This communication may contain information that is proprietary,
privileged, and confidential or otherwise legally protected from disclosure, and is intended to be received and read only by certain individuals. If it has been misdirected, or if you suspect you have received this in
error, you are not authorized to read, print, retain copy or disseminate this message or any part of it. Delivery of this message or any portions herein to any person other than the intended recipient is not intended to

waive any right or privilege. Please notify sender immediately and delete all copies of the message and its attachments

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 6:23 PM

To: Kushagra Shukla | 3T Worldwide <kushagra.shukla@3tworldwide.com>

Cc: Denzil George | 3T Worldwide <denzil.george@?3tworldwide.com>; Mohammad Imran | 3T Worldwide
<mohammad.imran@3tworldwide.com>; Paulsy Paul | 3T Worldwide <paulsy.paul@3tworldwide.com>; Ashish Vishnu |
Three T Worldwide Global Trading WLL <ashish.vishnu@?3tworldwide.com>

Subject: Re: PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd.

Good afternoon,

Thank you for your email. Please see my answers below:

Original commercial Invoice (signed and wet stamped by supplier & attested from Chamber of Commerce) and it should
mention proper description of item with Harmonized System Code(H.S Code) This would cost $80 from the (Chamber
of Commerce) and have a lead time of 1-2 weeks.

Detailed packing list (must show number of pc, weight in kg and dims in cm) | need to wait for this from a colleague so
will email it to you as soon as | can.

Certificate of origin issued and attested by the Chamber of Commerce, must be typewritten. As above, this would cost
$80 and have a lead time of 1-2 weeks.

Kind regards

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1759726332368939145%7Cmsg-f%3A17604393... 3/18


https://www.google.com/maps/search/701+Tillery+Street,+Suite+12?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:kushagra.shukla@3tworldwide.com
mailto:denzil.george@3tworldwide.com
mailto:mohammad.imran@3tworldwide.com
mailto:paulsy.paul@3tworldwide.com
mailto:ashish.vishnu@3tworldwide.com

15/03/2023, 14:07 Gmail - RE: PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd.
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 15 Mar 2023 at 09:15, Kushagra Shukla | 3T Worldwide <kushagra.shukla@3tworldwide.com> wrote:

Hello Kate,

Thank you for shipping the order via UPS 1Z.9W96380476495483.

Please also share the below documents:

1. Original commercial Invoice (signed and wet stamped by supplier & attested from Chamber of Commerce) and it should
mention proper description of item with Harmonized System Code(H.S Code)

2. Detailed packing list (must show number of pc, weight in kg and dims in cm)

3. Certificate of origin issued and attested by the Chamber of Commerce, must be typewritten.

Anticipating your immediate response. Have a good day ahead.
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