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M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Viamed / Confirmation / Oxygenhood / OUTSIDE EU

1 message

J. Mittendorf <j.mittendorf@dehas.de> 6 March 2023 at 11:52
To: "iartemovservinst@gmail.com" <iartemovservinst@gmail.com>, "ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk"
<ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Cc: "c.kramp@dehas.de" <c.kramp@dehas.de>, Simona Gerbitz <s.gerbitz@dehas.de>, Maike Bohnhoff
<m.bohnhoff@dehas.de>

Dear Ryan,

Hope you are fine !

Herewith we confirm the shipment of the oxygen hoods to a Country outside the EU.
The Oxygen Hoods will be shipped from DEHAS to Kazakhstan.

So first delivery Address will be DEHAS Medical Systems / Germany - we do the further shipment
in a project further on outside EU !

Do you need any Export documents after shipping as proof or is it good enough to confirm by
this mail ?

Best regards from Germany,

Jens

Jens Mittendorf

Geschéftsfihrer / Managing Director

WE THINK PRESSURE & FLOW

Mob: +49 170 208 3300
Fon: +49 45180904 - 200

Fax: +4945180904 -231

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1759619138377433290%7Cmsg-f%3A1759619138... 1/4
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Wesloer Stralle 107-109

23568 Lubeck

- = D E H A S of Quality
Medical Systems GmbH A./

Geschdftsfiihrung DEHAS : J. Mittendorf / HRB: 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.: DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschiitzte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtiimlich erhalten
haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser E-Mail ist nicht
gestattet. This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this e-mail in error, please notify
the sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden

Hi Tlia
We received the payment and the hoods are in production.

Regarding delivery address, Belorussia seems to be a problem, there are sanctions and licences
required.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

Hi llia,
please find attached payment confirmation for Viamed.
Invoices and updated balance will follow, tomorrow.

Mit freundlichen Grifen /with kind regards
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Maike Bohnhoff
Buchhaltung / Accounting

*** Wir sind umgezogen ***

Seit dem 08.08.2022 ist unsere Anschrift wie folgt / Please note our new address:
DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer StraBe 107-109

23568 Lubeck

WE THINK PRESSURE & FLOW

Fon: +49 451 80 90 4 - 113
Fax: +49 45180904 - 111
Mob: +49 172 14 22 011

A

Bleiben Sie auf dem Laufenden und besuchen Sie unsere Internetseite mit aktuellen Informationen
Keep informed - visit our Homepage with all new information

https://www.dehas.de/index.php/news

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH
Wesloer Strasse 107-109

23568 Lubeck

GERMANY

Geschaftsfuhrung DEHAS : J. Mittendorf / HRB: Libeck 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.: DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschitzte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht
der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtimlich erhalten haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den
Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe
dieser E-Mail ist nicht gestattet.

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient
or have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any
unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden.

Von: iartemovservinst@gmail.com [mailto:iartemovservinst@gmail.com]

Gesendet: Samstag, 14. Januar 2023 17:31

An: Maike Bohnhoff <m.bohnhoff@dehas.de>

Cc: J. Mittendorf <j.mittendorf@dehas.de>; Simona Gerbitz <s.gerbitz@dehas.de>; Purchasing
<purchasing@dehas.de>; nbsa AptemoB <iartemov@servinst.ru>; AnekcaHgp JlyknHos
<avlukinov@gmail.com>

Betreff: Re: Fwd: Viamed

Dear Maike and Jens.

| kindly ask again to pay this bill, Jens confirmed me that all is OK. Please send me payment confirmation, amount is 8,585
USD.

Best regards, llia
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Please find below resended letter from llya, as we again have "delivery error" report from our main e-mail server.

Best regards, Alexander Lukinov.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

OT1: Unbsa ApTemoB <iartemov@servinst.ru>

Date: c6, 7 aHB. 2023 1., 14:06

Subject: Viamed

To: Maike Bohnhoff <m.bohnhoff@dehas.de>

Cc: J. Mittendorf <j.mittendorf@dehas.de>, Simona Gerbitz <s.gerbitz@dehas.de>, Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de>,
AnekcaHgp JlykmHoB <avlukinov@gmail.com>

Dear Jens.
Please pay this bill and send us payment confirmation.

Certainly, send us invoice covering this payment + 3 %.

Best regards, llia

C yBaxeHuewm,
Nnba mailto:iartemov@servinst.ru

C ysaxeHuem,
lartemovservinst mailto:iartemovservinst@gmail.com

C ysaxeHuem,
lartemovservinst mailto:iartemovservinst@gmail.com

C ysaxxeHuem,
lartemovservinst mailto:iartemovservinst@gmail.com
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