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M Gmall Kate Griffiths <vi d.kate.griffi il.com>

RE: Price quotation
1 message

geral@furialltrade.pt <geral@furialltrade.pt> 9 March 2023 at 10
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

We

Anabela Cubeiro

Com os melhores cumprimentos
Kind Regards

Cordialement

Saludos

FUriBlltrade  ooermosem

Rua do Tanque n°123 . Tiago Bougado 4785-715 Trofa | Portugal

only need 1 unit.

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em Nome De Kate Giriffiths
Enviada: 9 de margo de 2023 08:58

Para: geral@furialltrade.pt

Assunto: Re: Price quotation

Good morning,
| would need to know how many sensors you require.

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges and insurance, | would need your invoice and delivery addresses in order to set up a

new account for you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
On Wed, 8 Mar 2023 at 16:57, <geral@furialltrade.pt> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Can you inform freight costs to Portugal?
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Anabela Cubeiro

Com os melhores cumprimentos
Kind Regards

Cordialement

Saludos

furialltrade o ermmom

Rua do Tanque n°123 S. Tiago Bougado 4785-715 Trofa | Portugal

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em Nome De Kate Griffiths
Enviada: 3 de margo de 2023 08:55

Para: geral@furialltrade.pt

Assunto: Re: Price quotation

Good morning Anabela,

Thank you for your enquiry. The price breaks are as follows:

1=€56.00

2 =€50.40 each EXW

3-10 = €47.60 each EXW

11 or more = €44.80 each EXW

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges and insurance, | would need your invoice and delivery addresses in order to set up a

new account for you.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will

be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR/ Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited

and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line

or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 2 Mar 2023 at 14:14, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

- Forwarded message
From: <geral@furialltrade.pt>
Date: Thu, 2 Mar 2023 at 14:08
Subject: Price quotation

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Dear sirs,

Please send us quotation for the following article:
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Oxygen Sensors

Oxygen Sensors

Part number 0110023
Product name : R-23V Oxygen Sensor
GTIN/EAN13 5051526000724

The R-23V Dual Cathode Oxygen Sensor is a simple, direct replacement to the Drager Werke™ / North American Drager™ 68-50645, Hewlett Packard™ 15201, P.RP.G." 505055-001
and Oxitron* 3710, offering long life and fast response.

Model Number R-23V

Main OEM Drager

QOEM Sensor Part No. 6850645
QOutput Connector Slip ings, 3
Sensor Output 24 -32 pA
Response Time = 12 seconds
Warranty 15 months

Anabela Cubeiro

Com os melhores cumprimentos
Kind Regards

Cordialement

Saludos
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