08/03/2023, 10:35

M Gmail

Re: PROFORMA REQUEST /MASTERMED /DUBAI

Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae>
To: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

AGREED replace the R-48V with the OOM113 (0110579).

PLEASE PROCEED SHIPPING URGENT

On 08/03/23 01:59 PM, Agib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hello

Good morning

Please see below for information on the 0110579.
Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@yviamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &simpl=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &mb=1

Gmail - Re: PROFORMA REQUEST /MASTERMED /DUBAI

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

Agib Majeed <viamed.agib.majeed@gmail.com>

8 March 2023 at 10:35

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered,
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 8 Mar 2023 at 09:53, Aqgib Majeed <aqgib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello

Good afternoon
Sorry for the delay in getting back to you.
Your order is still here with us as we are waiting on more stock to arrive for part 0110560 - OOM111, There is a current lead for this of 3-4 weeks.

| also need to advise you we do not have any of the R-48V left as they have been superseded by 0110579 which is just as compatible and the current price for that
is $40.00 each, | will attach some information below for the 0110579 Oxygen Sensor OOM113.

Please let me know if you agree for me to replace the R-48V with the OOM113 (0110579).
Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@yviamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.
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On Tue, 7 Mar 2023 at 13:24, Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Please let me know the status of my order . we need urgent delivery
Let us know ready items list so we can ship ready items tomorrow

Thanks & regards
Roshil

On 01/03/23 01:24 PM, Agib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello

Good morning

The order has still not been dispatched yet, as soon as we dispatch it we will email you a tracking number.
Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will
be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 28 Feb 2023 at 07:15, Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> wrote:
Dear Aqib,

Kindly forward the tracking number of the shipment .

Regards
Sreenith

On 21/02/23 02:55 PM, Aqib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hello

Good afternoon

We will add the remaining $131.24 to your next order.

| will proceed with this order and get it dispatched as soon as.
Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the
main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line
or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 21 Feb 2023 at 10:35, Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> wrote:
Dear Agib Majeed,

We dont know about exchange charges and all , We transferred as per your Proforma invoice 2761.43 USD
That including your bank charges too. In this case if you still need any payment pls add to next order .
Kindly ship out the consignment today with out fail .Shipment is urgent
Thanks & regards

Roshil
MASTERMED

On 20/02/23 05:23 PM, Agib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hello
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Good afternoon
Thank you, Payment was received but your bank has made this payment in GBP in to our USD account and is $131.24 short.

| will attach the bank transfer below where you can see how much was received by us from you in GBP and how much it
converted to.

Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.
Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance
on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 20 Feb 2023 at 09:08, Aqgib Majeed <aqgib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello

Good Morning

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &simpl=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &mb=1

6/18


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

08/03/2023, 10:35 Gmail - Re: PROFORMA REQUEST /MASTERMED /DUBAI
We are still waiting for your payment.

As soon as the payment arrives | will convert this to an order.
| will keep you updated as | will check the bank soon,
Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance
on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in
the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 20 Feb 2023 at 07:38, Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> wrote:
Dear Aqib,

Kindly update the status of the shipment .

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &simpl=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &mb=1 718
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Regards

Sreenith

On 17/02/23 01:10 PM, Aqib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hello

Good morning

Thank you for that.

We will only get this order ready for shipping when the money is visible in our account.
Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.
Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.

Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &simpl=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &mb=1
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 17 Feb 2023 at 06:34, Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> wrote:
Dear Aqib,

Please find the attached swift copy for the payment against the proforma invoice .

Kindly ship out the materials ASAP.

Regards

Sreenith

On 08/02/23 04:03 PM, Agib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello Roshil

Good afternoon

Please accept my reply on behalf of Sophie as she is on leave today.
| have amended your proforma for the amount you required, | will attach it below.
Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.

Kind Regards

Agib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &simpl=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &mb=1 9/18
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and
in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email
where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Mastermed !!

We are pleased to send the quotation for the requested items . Please find the attached quotation and

Catalog .

With Best Regards

RAJEESH. | Sales & Service Engineer

Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 421 5563
MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC
E07, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &simpl=msg-f%3A1759795450985046057 &mb=1
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P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae
www.mastermed.info

Email

Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the
recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur
in the future.

Dear Sir,
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Greetings from Mastermed !!

We are pleased to send the quotation for the requested items . Please find the attached quotation and Catalog .

With Best Regards

RAJEESH. | Sales & Service Engineer

Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 421 5563
MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC
EQ7, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City

P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae
www.mastermed.info

Email

Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the
recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
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of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur
in the future.

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Mastermed !!

We are pleased to send the quotation for the requested items . Please find the attached quotation and Catalog .

With Best Regards

RAJEESH. | Sales & Service Engineer

Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 421 5563
MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC
E07, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City

P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae
www.mastermed.info
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Email

Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the
recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur
in the future.

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Mastermed !!
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We are pleased to send the quotation for the requested items . Please find the attached quotation and Catalog .

With Best Regards

RAJEESH. | Sales & Service Engineer

Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 421 5563
MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC
EQ7, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City

P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae
www.mastermed.info

Email

Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the
recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur
in the future.
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Dear Sir,

Greetings from Mastermed !!

We are pleased to send the quotation for the requested items . Please find the attached quotation and Catalog .

With Best Regards

RAJEESH. | Sales & Service Engineer

Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 421 5563
MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC
E07, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City

P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae
www.mastermed.info

Email Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the
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recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur
in the future.

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Mastermed !!

We are pleased to send the quotation for the requested items . Please find the attached quotation and Catalog .

With Best Regards

RAJEESH. | Sales & Service Engineer

Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 421 5563
MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC
E07, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City

P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae
www.mastermed.info

Email Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the

recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
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If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur
in the future.
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