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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen sensor and flow sensor
1 message

majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com> 27 February 2023 at 16:19
Reply-To: majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com>
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hello
As i understand if I buy 5 boxes flow sensor (4310002) it will cost 90 $,
So plz send me invoice with 5 boxes of
 (4310002)
And oxygen sensor for draeger fabius 25 pcs

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On 2023 ,24 الجمعة, فبراير at 5:45 م, Kate Griffiths
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon,

Part number 4310002 has the following price breaks:

1-4 = $ 150.00 each
box EXW

5-9 = $ 90.00  each
box EXW

10-24 = $ 82.50  each
box EXW

25 or more = $ 75.00 per
box of 5

0110023 - no price breaks, just $43.75 each EXW.

Part number 4310002 - no price breaks, just $150 each EXW.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Fri, 24 Feb 2023 at 15:27, majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hello
 Now i understand that you price break,
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