23/02/2023, 10:30 Gmail - RE: Order 03032286GB Tracking 1z8w47826897215484

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Order 03032286GB Tracking 1z28w47826897215484

1 message

Jacek Zachara <jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl> 23 February 2023 at 10:23

Reply-To: jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan

Welcome in the New Year ©

How are You

| try contact with Jean but no answer

| would like to order 5 x R-17VAN

Despite the difficulties in deliveries, | still have customers for your sensors ©
Best Regards

Jacek

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Friday, April 1, 2022 10:13 AM

To: Jacek Zachara

Subject: Re: Order 03032286GB Tracking 1z8w47826897215484

Hi Jacek

We only offer the O2 sensor for the ATA Pro, this would be the R-22AT.

R-22AT = GBP £35 each EXW

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1728360569250367378%7Cmsg-f%3A1758616964...
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23/02/2023, 10:30 Gmail - RE: Order 03032286GB Tracking 1z8w47826897215484
On Fri, 1 Apr 2022 at 08:16, Jacek Zachara <jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl> wrote:

Hi Gail

Which sensor do you recommend for the Analox ATA Pro?
See the photo in the attachment

Best Regards

Jacek

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Gail Bell
Sent: Tuesday, March 29, 2022 3:12 PM

To: jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl

Subject: Re: Order 03032286GB Tracking 1z8w47826897215484

Good afternoon Jacek,

Thank you very much for payment detail confirmation for payment of invoice RAN135757-1. This has now been
processed.

Kind regards

Gail Bell
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900
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23/02/2023, 10:30 Gmail - RE: Order 03032286GB Tracking 1z8w47826897215484
On Sat, 26 Mar 2022 at 11:11, Jacek Zachara <jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl> wrote:

Hi Gail
Please you can get money from my Visa card ( 4193...5268) for the last invoice
Best Regards

Jacek

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Gail Bell
Sent: Thursday, March 3, 2022 3:43 PM

To: jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl

Subject: Order 03032286GB Tracking 1z8w47826897215484

Dear Jacek Zachara,

| am writing to inform you that your order, 03032286GB has been dispatched.

You can track your order reference 03032286GB on the UPS website, www.ups.com, with the following tracking
number 1z8w47826897215484.

Please see attached delivery note, DAN135757-1 and a copy of your invoice, RAN135757-1.

Kind Regards

Gail Bell

Vandagraph Ltd
gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Wolny od wiruséw. www.avg.com
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