22/02/2023, 15:23 Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor and flow sensor

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen sensor and flow sensor
1 message

majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com> 22 February 2023 at 15:16
Reply-To: majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com>
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hello

Could you send me invoice with

Oxygen sensor 25 pcs

Flow sensor 5 boxes as in attached files.

My adress in uk is

Mijdi W M Jaber

Aramex UK SNS Unit 9 Skyport Drive
TIP 184264

West Drayton

Harmondsworth

UB7 OLB

United Kingdom

01753-210399

Plz note to put my code on the box as
(TIP 184264)

EXW Ex Works UK * Incoterms® 2020 Page 1/1
Your Viamed Contact for this Proforma : ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Iltem Reference Description Quantity £ Unit £ Unit Vat £ Total
0110023 Viamed Oxygen Sensor R-23V 30 28.00 0.00 840.00
4310001 SpiroTrue Flowsensor A Box of 5 2 49.50 0.00 99.00
EXW Delivery: EXW - Viamed UK (Incoterms 2020) 1 0.00 0.00 0.00

36x36x25cm, 3.4kg

Consigned to:
Aramex UK
01753-210399
Account: TIP 184264

Total Net: £ 939.00
Total Vat: £ 0.00
Total: £ 939.00

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On 2023 ,22 s ¢+l Y at 3:19 4, Kate Griffiths
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon,
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22/02/2023, 15:23 Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor and flow sensor
Thank you for your reply.

The pricing in UKE is £34 each EXW. Are you able to say which flow sensors you require please?
I would also need the UK shipping address in order to complete a proforma invoice.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 22 Feb 2023 at 09:29, majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hello
Thank you for your reply
| think price is less
Could you offer me last price with £
Regarding courier i have account in aramex, you jusd need to send shipment to their office in uk

Mijdi W M Jaber

182-21 150th Avenue

TIP 184264

Springfield Gardens

NY

11413

United States

718-553-8740

Waiting for invoice with that with last price
We are looking for further business

Best regards
Dr Majdi wanis

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On 2023 ,22 iy s ¥ at 11:18 o=, Kate Griffiths
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning,

Thank you for your email.

The prices are as follows:
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R-23V - part number 0110023 costs $43.75 each EXW
| have attached a leaflet about the flow sensors, please let me know which you are interested in.

We normally use UPS for delivery and it seems that UPS do not offer any services to Libya at this time. Do
you have a courier account you can use to collect the goods?

Please could | ask for your delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you? | can
then issue a proforma invoice.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 22 Feb 2023 at 09:07, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com>
Date: Tue, 21 Feb 2023 at 16:49

Subject: Oxygen sensor and flow sensor

To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Hello

We are Sabeel alyoser medical company working in tripoli-libya

Could you send me invoice with

20 pcs of viamed oxygen sensor R 23 v which is compatible for draeger fabius gs anaesthesia machine
(0110023)

And spiro true flow sensor 2 boxes of 5
Waiting for your reply

Best regards
Dr Majdi wanis

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android
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