22/02/2023, 09:45 Gmail - Fwd: New Tender KO.13/23

M Gmall Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>

Fwd: New Tender KO.13/23

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 21 February 2023 at 16:37
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

Cc: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi Janine

Please can you send another proforma invoice to Nicoleta, this time for 1x 4420874
(nearly the same as RVM141893-1)

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu>
Date: Tue, 21 Feb 2023 at 10:50

Subject: RE: New Tender KO.13/23
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Ryan

We need one shipping case

Thanks

Best Regards

Nicoleta Georgiou | CUSTOMER SERVICE

M=DISERA

£% rHc
T +357 22 104300 PFOUB&'L—‘DI:"ZPIEH;-.\;-;
F +357 22 103752 Chavity Foundation

E n.georgiou@medisera.eu

Alikou Potamou 30
Nisou Industrial Area
2571
www.medisera.eu

This email is confidential. If received in error, inform the sender immediately and do not copy the email, use its contents or disclose them
to an unauthorised third party.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 21 February 2023 12:21

To: Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu>

Subject: Re: New Tender KO.13/23

Hi Nicoleta
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How many pieces do you need?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 21 Feb 2023 at 09:48, Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu> wrote:

HI Ryan

We will manage the deadline with the authorities to take the samples afterwards, just pls arrange the samples

Thanks

Best Regards

Nicoleta Georgiou | cUSTOMER SERVICE
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This email is confidential. If received in error, inform the sender immediately and do not copy the email, use its contents or
disclose them to an unauthorised third party.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 21 February 2023 11:47

To: Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu>

Subject: Re: New Tender KO.13/23

Hi Nicoleta

Yes, as | mentioned it was not a complete piece (no monitor connection). We did not have any of the 4420874 available from stock.

What is the deadline for the 4420874 if we are to have them made?

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 21 Feb 2023 at 09:40, Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

About the code 4420874 did you send it lose without a packaging and labelling?

If yes then they will take us out of specs. The samples should be identical to the final products in case of winning

Can you pls arrange to produce some samples for the code 44208747

Thanks

Best Regards

Nicoleta Georgiou | CUSTOMER SERVICE

M=DISERA

T+357 22 104300 PROUDLY SUPPORTING
Hand in Hand
F+357 22 103752 Charity Foundation

E n.georgiou@medisera.eu

Alikou Potamou 30
Nisou Industrial Area
2571
www.medisera.eu

This email is confidential. If received in error, inform the sender immediately and do not copy the email, use its contents or
disclose them to an unauthorised third party.

From: Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu>
Sent: 21 February 2023 09:54

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Subject: RE: New Tender KO.13/23

Dear Ryan Good day

Thank you for the letter and samples

| look forward to receive the samples

I will much appreciate if you can send me the pictures labels by tomorrow for both codes 4420874 and 4420873

Thanks
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Best Regards

Nicoleta Georgiou | cUSTOMER SERVICE
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Alikou Potamou 30
Nisou Industrial Area
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This email is confidential. If received in error, inform the sender immediately and do not copy the email, use its contents or
disclose them to an unauthorised third party.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 20 February 2023 17:56

To: Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu>

Subject: Re: New Tender KO.13/23

Hi Nicoleta

| have amended the Origin Declaration to include the information you requested.

Your box of 4420873 was dispatched on Thursday, UPS tracking: 1Z29W9638044 1257546

We did not have any samples of 4420874, but | have included a sample of the line and airway adapter (without connector)

In regards to the labelling, | only have the document | sent to you. Maybe you could take pictures of the box when it arrives or | can take some pictures on
Wednesday for you, when | am next in the office?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 20 Feb 2023 at 06:50, Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu> wrote:

Good Morning Ryan,

Thank you for the label. Can you pls send the labels showing only the codes 4420874 and 4420873

Yes | need the declaration to prove that we meet the specs with our offered products.

« Have 15F/15M connectors for connection directly to a tracheal tube
« Expiratory gas collection set for measurement of capnography for kid/adults

Did you send the existing sample that you have?
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Thanks

Best Regards

Nicoleta Georgiou | cUSTOMER SERVICE

ME=DISERA

T+357 22 104300
F+357 22 103752
E n.georgiou@medisera.eu

Alikou Potamou 30
Nisou Industrial Area
2571
www.medisera.eu

Gmail - Fwd: New Tender KO.13/23
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This email is confidential. If received in error, inform the sender immediately and do not copy the email, use its contents or

disclose them to an unauthorised third party.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine

Sent: 17 February 2023 18:51

To: Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu>

Subject: Re: New Tender KO.13/23

Hi Nicoleta

| have attached the label designs.

The airway adapters are a standard size and are designed specifically to fit onto ET tubes, are you sure you need this on a separate declaration?

| have not requested any 4420874 be manufactured, as this would normally take at least a few weeks and we did not have the time to do this before the end of

your tender submission.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 17 Feb 2023 at 09:15, Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu> wrote:

Hi Ryan

| still need the below declarations:

For the below spec can you pls add them either on the Technical data sheet or to a declaration letter:

* Have 15F/15M connectors for connection directly to a tracheal tube
« Expiratory gas collection set for measurement of capnography for kid/adults
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Pls also send me the Labels / Artworks of individual packing for each code

Thanks

Best Regards

Nicoleta Georgiou | CUSTOMER SERVICE

ME=DISERA
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This email is confidential. If received in error, inform the sender immediately and do not copy the email, use its contents or
disclose them to an unauthorised third party.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 16 February 2023 18:02

To: Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu>

Subject: Re: New Tender KO.13/23

Dear Nicoleta

Please find the documents attached.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 14 Feb 2023 at 07:03, Nicoleta Georgiou <n.georgiou@medisera.eu> wrote:
Hi Ryan

[Quoted text hidden]
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