21/02/2023, 14:00 Gmail - Sv: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 440756

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Sv: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 440756

Anna Carlin <anna.carlin@swevet.se> 21 February 2023 at 13:56
To: "agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk" <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,
We want 25 units of the article. Is there 25 units in one package? In that case we want 1 package with 25 units. Not 25 packages with 25 units.
Best Regards,

Anna Carlin

Purchasing Assistant

Jswevet

Direkt +46 416-258 23
Vaxel +46 771-21 55 00
Swevet AB

Forskaregatan 1D

SE-275 37 SJOBO, SWEDEN

Org.nr 556621-5843

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1758449166589221707 &simpl=msg-f%3A1758449166589221707 &mb=1 1/8
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www.swevet.se
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Fran: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Fér Agib Majeed
Skickat: den 21 februari 2023 14:54

Till: Anna Carlin <anna.carlin@swevet.se>

Amne: Re: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 440756

Hello Anna

Can | just confirm you are wanting 25 x 44205317

If yes, your PO states they are €1.25 each whereas the actual price is €31.25 each.
Please let me know so | can proceed with the order.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1758449166589221707&simpl=msg-f%3A1758449166589221707&mb=1 2/8
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 21 Feb 2023 at 12:35, Aqib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hello
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Thank you

I will proceed with the order now.

Kind regards

Aqgib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 21 Feb 2023 at 12:29, Anna Carlin <anna.carlin@swevet.se> wrote:

Hi,
Yes | accept it. You can proceed the order.
Best Regards,

Anna Carlin

Purchasing Assistant

JJswevet

Direkt +46 416-258 23
Vaxel +46 771-21 55 00

Swevet AB
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Forskaregatan 1D
SE-275 37 SJOBO, SWEDEN
Org.nr 556621-5843

www.swevet.se

CUSTOMER SATISFACTION 85 &
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Fran: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Fér Agib Majeed
Skickat: den 21 februari 2023 12:15

Till: Anna Carlin <anna.carlin@swevet.se>

Amne: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 440756

Hello Anna

Good morning

Thank you for your order, 440756.

| would like to advise you you have the incorrect price for 0110017 R-17MED, This price was updated on the 04/02/2023.

The current price is €45.70 each.
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Please let me know if you accept this so | can proceed with the order.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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