14/02/2023, 10:23 Gmail - Fwd: Purchase order number E1/130223

M Gma” Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>

Fwd: Purchase order number E1/130223

Cathy Green <office@viamed.co.uk> 14 February 2023 at 08:43
Reply-To: cathy.green@viamed.co.uk
To: office@vmsecure.me.uk

Reply from Oxylink in regards to one of the sensors on his order, Sophie was dealing with it, but she is off today.
thanks Cathy

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Oxylink - Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl>
Date: Tue, 14 Feb 2023 at 07:11

Subject: Re: Purchase order number E1/130223
To: <cathy.green@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Cathy,

0110020 please.

Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,

Piotr Podkowa
Oxylink
Mobile: +48 509 701 509

wt., 14 lut 2023 o 08:04 Cathy Green <office@viamed.co.uk> napisat(a):
Dear Piotr

Please could you confirm which type of R22VI you would like
0110072 matched pair
0110020 Single

Kind Regards
Cathy Green

On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 16:48, Oxylink - Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl> wrote:
Hi Cathy,

Thank you. I'm sorry | wasn't aware my account is on hold. | will look into payments tonight.

Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,

Piotr Podkowa
Oxylink
Mobile: +48 509 701 509

pon., 13 lut 2023 o 17:34 Cathy Green <office@viamed.co.uk> napisat(a):
Dear Piotr

Thank you for your email. | will pass this order onto our office. | will request for the Max-13CS to be ordered.
I'm afraid that your account is still on stop at the moment, | will reserve the sensors for you.

Kind Regards
Cathy Green
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6321039d91&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A17577953307521159308&simpl=msg-f%3A175779...  1/2


mailto:piotr@oxylink.pl
mailto:cathy.green@viamed.co.uk
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:piotr@oxylink.pl
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk

14/02/2023, 10:23 Gmail - Fwd: Purchase order number E1/130223

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6321039d91&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A17577953307521159308&simpl=msg-f%3A175779...  2/2



