14/02/2023, 09:40 Gmail - Re:

M Gmall Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Re:

1 message

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> 14 February 2023 at 09:34

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Good morning Kate,

Thank you for proceed new order.
yes, we will arrange package collection from Skycargo express.

Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Tue, Feb 14, 2023, 2:48 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Sudath,

The weights and dimensions are as follows:

2.2kg, 31x31x18cm

Are you happy for us to proceed using Skycargo Express?
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 12:21, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thank you Sudath, your order is confirmed (using Skynet Express). We will send you weights and dimensions as soon as your order is ready.

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 11:56, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Thank you for your email, yes this proforma invoice is accepted, please proceed the order.

We have to pay one pending payment for RVM141379-1 (GBP-593.60),we can settle in this week
Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates

Sri Lanka.

On Mon, Feb 13, 2023 at 4:36 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Sudath,

Thank you for your email.

Please see attached proforma invoice, | have added 1 x 4310009, this is because we now have no stock of part number 4310003. | have
checked with Ryan Swaine, he confirms that the items are identical, the only difference is that part number 4310009 will have Bluepoint labelling,
not Viamed.

Please let me know if you would like me to change your proforma invoice to a confirmed order.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 09:54, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Thank you for new proforma invoice, it is ok, can you add 1 box (06Pcs) Flow sensor (P/N-4310003), for Hamilton ventilator
What's different P/N-4310003 (Flow sensor ) & 4310009 (Spiro True),

Please arrange the above order, the payment through PayPal and shipping Skycargo express

Thanks & regards,

Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Feb 10, 2023 at 10:01 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi again Sudath,

Please see attached proforma invoice as requested.
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Please let me know if you require any changes to be made. | can of course change from PayPal and change the courier name.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will
be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Fri, 10 Feb 2023 at 14:10, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Kate,

Available stocks MAX-250E Oxygen sensors?

Please send quotation for 25Pcs
Will confirm the order on next week

Thanks & Regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Feb 10, 2023, 7:09 PM Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Thanks for your reply, we will get the data sheet for above sensor.
Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Feb 10, 2023, 5:47 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Sudath,

| have checked with Ryan, and he has informed me that unfortunately we are unable to supply the sensor in your picture. | am sorry |
was unable to assist you with that one.

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main
office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject
line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 10 Feb 2023 at 11:29, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Thank you for your email,
Please find the attachment. Image of Hamilton oxygen sensor.

Best regards,
Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka
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