
13/02/2023, 09:58 Gmail - Fwd: Teledyne UFO Sensors

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1757561394780644444&simpl=msg-f%3A1757561394780644444&mb=1 1/4

Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Teledyne UFO Sensors
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 11 February 2023 at 18:45
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please provide them with a proforma invoice. 

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ziad Mehanna <zmehanna@hotmail.com>
Date: Sat, 11 Feb 2023, 18:13
Subject: RE: Teledyne UFO Sensors
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

 

Thanks for the reply.

Kindly send me a Proforma Invoice

UFO130-2 P/N: 0110081

Qty: 2

Unit Price: 166.50

Total Price: $333

 

Please quote including Express courier charges to the following address:

mailto:zmehanna@hotmail.com
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Name:             ZIAD MEHANNA

Address:          5th Floor, Massaad Building,

Main Road, Ballouneh,

Lebanon

Phone Nr:       +961 3 627428

Email:              zmehanna@hotmail.com

Kind regards,

 

Ziad Mehanna

Whatsapp Mobile: +961 3 627 428
* zmehanna@hotmail.com

5th Floor, Massaad Bldg, Main Road, Ballouneh, Lebanon

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Friday, February 10, 2023 11:38 AM
To: ziadmehana@khayatmedical.com
Subject: Teledyne UFO Sensors

 

Dear Ziad

 

Please accept my reply to your emails regarding the supply of UFO130-2 sensors.

 

We would be happy to supply you, please find our distributor pricing below:

 

mailto:zmehanna@hotmail.com
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UFO130-2 - pn: 0110081 =

 1+ = USD $ 166.50 each EXW

 25+ = USD $ 149.80 each EXW

 

I am happy to confirm that we have stock available and we would arrange dispatch as soon as payment is received against a proforma invoice.

 

If you would like to proceed with an order, please let me know your complete delivery and invoice details and we will reply with a proforma invoice.

 

I look forward to hearing from you and please let me know if you have any questions.

 

Kind regards

Ryan

 

 

 

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

2 attachments

image002.png
2K

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=07ddd72f30&view=att&th=18641cc6ced7245c&attid=0.1&disp=inline&realattid=18641cb4e985b16b21&safe=1&zw


13/02/2023, 09:58 Gmail - Fwd: Teledyne UFO Sensors

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1757561394780644444&simpl=msg-f%3A1757561394780644444&mb=1 4/4

image002.png
2K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=07ddd72f30&view=att&th=18641cc6ced7245c&attid=0.2&disp=inline&realattid&safe=1&zw

