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MDS Medical Ltd <david.thomas@mdsmedical.co.uk> Tue, Feb 7, 2023 at 3:26 PM
To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Hi Sophie

Yes, if we could please have the items you have in stock with the sensor to follow that would be great.
| have just made a BACS payment so the funds should be in your account immediately.

If you need any further information please do not hesitate to contact us.

Kind regards

Mandy

MDS Medical Ltd

Tel: 01536 401607
www.mdsmedical.co.uk

Company Registration 7404753 registered in England. VAT registration 119 2476 11

This email and its attachments may be confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is
addressed. Any views or opinions expressed are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of
MDS Medical Ltd.

If you are not the intended recipient of this email and its attachments, you must take no action based upon them, nor
must you copy or show them to anyone.

Please contact the sender if you believe you have received this email in error

On Tue, 7 Feb 2023 at 13:37, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear David,

Please find attached your Proforma Invoice for the items requested.

Unfortunately, we do not currently have the sensor in stock (part number 0110660) however, we would be happy to
part ship the other items on the order now, and the sensor once this becomes available.

Please let me know if there are any changes required to any of the details.
Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542
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