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M Gmail

Re: O2 diverter

1 message

ANDREW KELLY <andy@kellymedicalprojects.com>

To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Hi

Ive paid the invoice.
Ref kellymedical

Thanks

Regards

Andy Kelly
Manager
Kelly Medical Projects Ltd

E: andy@kellymedicalprojects.com
M: 07889 546 757

Kelly Medical Projects Ltd is a Private Limited Company registered in England & Wales Company
Number: 12774178. Registered Office: 3 The Vinery, New Longton, PR4 4YB.

This e-mail is private and confidential and may be legally privileged and it is for the intended recipient only. If you are

not the intended recipient please notify us immediately at andy@kellymedicalprojects.com and delete this message
from your computer and destroy any copies.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1757095305051163005%7Cmsg-f%3A175715565...

On 6 Feb 2023, at 16:21, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Andy,

Thank you for your reply. Please find attached a Proforma Invoice for the items you require - if | have all
your details correct (address, quantities etc) and you are happy to proceed, please let me know and |
can then proceed with this order.

| can then request that my colleague in the warehouse, Cathy Green, contacts you for payment
tomorrow when she comes to pick and pack your order, as she is the lady with access to our card
machine.

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to
the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Tue, Feb 7, 2023 at 7:16 AM
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E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject
line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, Feb 6, 2023 at 4:04 PM Andrew Kelly <andy@kellymedicalprojects.com> wrote:
Hi.
Can | order everything | need please.
| have my card if you do payments over the phone
Regards

Andy Kelly
Manager
Kelly Medical Projects Ltd

E: andy@kellymedicalprojects.com

M: 07889 546 757

Kelly Medical Projects Ltd is a Private Limited Company registered in England & Wales Company
Number: 12774178. Registered Office: 3 The Vinery, New Longton, PR4 4YB.

This e-mail is private and confidential and may be legally privileged and it is for the intended
recipient only. If you are not the intended recipient please notify us immediately

at andy@kellymedicalprojects.com and delete this message from your computer and destroy

any copies. This email is not intended to be relied upon without subsequent confirmation of its
contents. Accordingly Kelly Medical Projects Ltd disclaim all liability so far as permitted by law for any
person acting, or refraining from acting, on such information prior to receipt of subsequent written
confirmation.

On 6 Feb 2023, at 15:35, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Andy,

Thank you for your email. | can confirm the price for part number 0120399 ( "T" adapter.
22mm I.D. - 22mm O.D. Pack of 5) is £25.00 plus VAT and Carriage.

Regarding the MX300 docking cradle, | believe the part you require is 0100172
(Mounting stand for AX300 & MX300).

This part number excludes the rubber feet (0131205 x 3 required per unit).
| have attached our price list for the MX/AX300 spare parts.

If you require any further information please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, Feb 6, 2023 at 3:17 PM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: ANDREW KELLY <andy@kellymedicalprojects.com>
Date: Mon, 6 Feb 2023 at 15:14

Subject: O2 diverter

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Hi.
Can you give me a price and availability please for these below.

Also would you possibly be able to supply the docking cradle for an MX300-I

Regards

Andy Kelly
Manager
Kelly Medical Projects Ltd

E: andy@kellymedicalprojects.com
M: 07889 546 757

Kelly Medical Projects Ltd is a Private Limited Company registered in England

& Wales Company Number: 12774178. Registered Office: 3 The Vinery,

New Longton, PR4 4YB.

This e-mail is private and confidential and may be legally privileged and it is for the
intended recipient only. If you are not the intended recipient please notify

us immediately at andy@kellymedicalprojects.com and delete this message from
your computer and destroy any copies.
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