03/02/2023, 12:22 Gmail - Fwd: PROFORMA REQUEST /MASTERMED /DUBAI

M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: PROFORMA REQUEST /MASTERMED /DUBAI

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Fri, Feb 3, 2023 at 10:55 AM

To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: <mastermd@emirates.net.ae>

Date: Fri, 3 Feb 2023 at 10:14

Subject: PROFORMA REQUEST /MASTERMED /DUBAI
To: <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <mastermd@emirates.net.ae>

Dear Sarah,

Please send proforma invoice for following

1. R-30V OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 2

2. R-47V OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 10

3. OOM111 Oxygen Sensor -QTY 3

4. R-43V Oxygen Sensor Giraffe -QTY 2

5. MAX-250TM Oxygen Sensor -QTY 2

6. R-48V Oxygen Sensor - QTY 2

With Best Regards

ROSHIL | Managing Director

Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 1183880
MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC

E07, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City
P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d 104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1756807054415826575%7Cmsg-f%3A175680705...
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www.mastermed.info
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Equipment Trading L.L.C THE EMIRATES

Dubai Derma

Skin Health is our Concern

Booth Number: - 500

Email

Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the
recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur

in the future.

Shaping the Future of
Dermatology & Aesthetics

1 -3 March 2023

Dubai World Trade Centre, UAE

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: 03 February 2022 13:13
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To: Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae>
Subject: Re: Re: Order 24012251SL Tracking 1Z9W96380476808877

Dear Roshil,

| have passed this on to our International Sales Manager to sort for you. Ryan will email you a new authorisation
letter later on today.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative
Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Thu, 3 Feb 2022 at 09:01, Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> wrote:

Dear Sarah,

Hope you received the mail .

Appreciate your earliest response.

Regards

Roshil

-------- Original Message --------

From: "Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC" <mastermd@emirates.net.ae>
Date: Feb 2, 2022 2:59:55 PM

Subject: Re: Order 24012251SL Tracking 1Z9W96380476808877

To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Dear Sarah,

Please find the attached authorization letter which provide two years back , Which was expired now .

Kindly send the new authorization letter for clearance of oxygen sensor ( process of Ministry Of Health Permit ).

Regards

Roshil

On 01/02/22 07:13 PM, Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Roshil,

I am writing to inform you that your order has been dispatched.

You can track your order on the UPS website, www.ups.com, with the following tracking number
1Z9W96380476808877.

Please see attached delivery note, DVM135043-1 and a copy of your invoice, RVM135043-1.

Kind Regards

Sarah Walton
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Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Mastermed !!

We are pleased to send the quotation for the requested items . Please find the attached quotation and Catalog .
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With Best Regards

RAJEESH. | Sales & Service Engineer

Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 421 5563

MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC

E07, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City

P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae

www.mastermed.info

Email

Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the
recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur
in the future.

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Mastermed !!
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We are pleased to send the quotation for the requested items . Please find the attached quotation and Catalog .

With Best Regards

RAJEESH. | Sales & Service Engineer

Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 421 5563

MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC

E07, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City

P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae

www.mastermed.info

Email

Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the
recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur
in the future.
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