27/01/2023, 13:54

M Gmail

Re: Purchase Order 5226312

1 message

Gmail - Re: Purchase Order 5226312

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

FARROW, Judith (THE ROTHERHAM NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <judith.farrow@nhs.net>

To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi
Yes please

Thanks

Judith Farrow
Ward Clerk

Special Care Baby Unit

Rotherham Nhs Foundation Trust
Moorgate Road
Rotherham

S60 2UD

Telephone: 01709 424488
Internal Extension 4488

Email: Judith.farrow@nhs.net

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Sent: 27 January 2023 13:25

To: FARROW, Judith (THE ROTHERHAM NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <judith.farrow@nhs.net>

Subject: Re: Purchase Order 5226312

27 January 2023 at 13:53

This message originated from outside of NHSmail. Please do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Thank you Judith,

Would you like me to amend your order as follows:

Order Confirmation CVM141615

CPT Carriage Paid To Rotherham Hospital, UK * Incoterms®& 2020

Page 1

Your Viamed Contact for this Order Confirmation : kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Itern Reference Description

1114015 NeoMask Neonatal Phototherapy Mask
Model: Type Il Large.
Pack of 20.

1114006 EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask - Premie
Ref. R300P02
Pack of 20

1114007 EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask - Micro
Ref. R300P03
Pack of 20

PPUPS1 UPS Courier Delivery - Standard

This shows the alternative instead of 1114015 x2.

Many thanks.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

£ Unit Vat £ Total
7.68 92.16
9.20 55.20
8.40 50.40
2.00 12.00

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be

answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may
be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

On Fri, 27 Jan 2023 at 13:21, FARROW, Judith (THE ROTHERHAM NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <judith.farrow@nhs.net> wrote:
Hi

| can't amend any prices but would ask that our procurement do this for all future orders please, if you could send the alternative as
well .

Thanks

Judith Farrow
Ward Clerk

Special Care Baby Unit

Rotherham Nhs Foundation Trust
Moorgate Road
Rotherham

S60 2UD

Telephone: 01709 424488
Internal Extension 4488

Email: Judith.farrow@nhs.net

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: 27 January 2023 12:24

To: FARROW, Judith (THE ROTHERHAM NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <judith.farrow@nhs.net>

Subject: Re: Purchase Order 5226312

This message originated from outside of NHSmail. Please do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.
Good afternoon Judith,
Thank you for your PO 5226312.
| need to advise you that your order has incorrect prices. The EyeMax pricing is as follows:
1114005 - Regular (Blue) - Pack of 20 = £48.00
1114006 - Premie (Orange) - Pack of 20 = £46.00
1114007 - Micro (Green) - Pack of 20 = £42.00
Are you happy to accept the correct price please?

| also need to advise you that part number 1114005 has a lead time of approximately 3-4 weeks.

We can offer an in stock alternative from the NeoMask range - part number 1114015, the price is £38.40 per pack of twenty. | have attached a leaflet
and price list.

Please let me know if you require the alternative.
Otherwise, we will of course ship your order as soon as stock is available/correct price has been accepted.
Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

On Fri, 27 Jan 2023 at 12:05, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <rgh-tr.directpurchase@nhs.net>

Date: Fri, 27 Jan 2023 at 12:03

Subject: Purchase Order 5226312

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <rgh-tr.directpurchase@nhs.net>, <judith.farron@nhs.net>

Please find attached a copy of our Purchase Order. The person named on the document should be advised of the delivery date by return. Your
delivery note and invoice should clearly state the purchase order number for prompt payment. NHS terms and conditions apply unless otherwise
agreed in writing. Regards, The Rotherham NHS Foundation Trust

This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient please:

i) inform the sender that you have received the message in error before deleting it; and

ii) do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any action in relation to its content (to do so is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful).

Thank you for your co-operation.

NHSmail is the secure email, collaboration and directory service available for all NHS staff in England. NHSmail is approved for exchanging patient
data and other sensitive information with NHSmail and other accredited email services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch visit Joining NHSmail — NHSmail Support<https://support.nhs.net/article-categories/joining-
nhsmail/>
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This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient please:

i) inform the sender that you have received the message in error before deleting it; and

ii) do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any action in relation to its content
(to do so is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful).

Thank you for your co-operation.

NHSmail is the secure email, collaboration and directory service available for all NHS staff in England. NHSmail
is approved for exchanging patient data and other sensitive information with NHSmail and other accredited email
services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch visit Joining NHSmail — NHSmail Support
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This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient please:

i) inform the sender that you have received the message in error before deleting it; and

ii) do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any action in relation to its content
(to do so is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful) .

Thank you for your co-operation.

NHSmail is the secure email, collaboration and directory service available for all NHS staff in England. NHSmail
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is approved for exchanging patient data and other sensitive information with NHSmail and other accredited email
services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch visit Joining NHSmail — NHSmail Support
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