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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RES: Comprovante de Pagamento SWIFT
1 message

Jair <jair@totalmat.com.br> 26 January 2023 at 17:20
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: Luc - Totalmat <luc@totalmat.com.br>, Aline - Totalmat <aline@totalmat.com.br>

Hello Ryan

 

Yes, we will proceed with this order even by another incoterm. Please, help us with it.

 

Sorry for the late payments. That’s a question we must solve with our finance dept.

 

Att

 

 

 

 

Jair Campos

Engenharia

 

Email: jair@totalmat.com.br

Phone: 11 5524 3918

 

Rua Augusto Ferreira de Morais, 282

Socorro - São Paulo - SP

www.totalmat.com.br

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine
Enviada em: quinta-feira, 26 de janeiro de 2023 13:47
Para: Jair <jair@totalmat.com.br>
Assunto: Re: Comprovante de Pagamento SWIFT

 

Thank you Jair

 

It appears that there is already a quotation on our system for 30x R-17VAN sensors from 4th January, please find
it attached.
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We do not use FCA, only EXW or CIP (if we are the transport).

 

Please let me know if you are happy to proceed with this order?

 

Please note that we give you 30 days credit from the date of invoice. If payments are consistently late, our accounts
department is likely to revoke the credit facility.

 

I will await your reply.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Thu, 26 Jan 2023 at 14:41, Jair <jair@totalmat.com.br> wrote:

Hello Ryan

 

Our payment voucher about that 700 pound balance is attached.

 

Please, I want purchase more 30 sensors by credit. Send us a quotation as you can.

 

Another favor: shipping by FCA incoterms.

 

Att

 

 

Jair Campos

Engenharia
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Email: jair@totalmat.com.br

Phone: 11 5524 3918

 

Rua Augusto Ferreira de Morais, 282

Socorro - São Paulo - SP

www.totalmat.com.br

 

 

De: Admin - Totalmat <admin@totalmat.com.br>
Enviada em: terça-feira, 24 de janeiro de 2023 18:00
Para: Luc - Totalmat <luc@totalmat.com.br>
Cc: 'Jair-Totalmat' <jair@totalmat.com.br>
Assunto: ENC: Comprovante de Pagamento SWIFT

 

 

 

De: documentoscambio@ourinvest.com.br <documentoscambio@ourinvest.com.br>
Enviada em: terça-feira, 24 de janeiro de 2023 17:56
Para: admin@totalmat.com.br
Assunto: Comprovante de Pagamento SWIFT

 

    Ourinvest

Totalmat Industria E Comercio De Equipamentos Hiperbaricos Ltda,

Segue anexo o comprovante SWIFT.

Em caso de dúvidas estamos à disposição.

Atenciosamente,

Banco Ourinvest – Câmbio Private.

WWW.OURINVEST.COM.BR | CAMBIOPRIVATE@OURINVEST.COM.BR
4081-4448 (Capital e regiões metropolitanas)

0800 775 4444 (Demais Localidades)

AV. PAULISTA, Nº 1.728 - SOBRELOJA, 2º E 11º ANDAR - BELA VISTA - CEP 01310-919 - SÃO PAULO – SP

TELEFONE: (55 11) 4081-4444 / FAX: (55 11) 4081-4442
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TELEFONE PARA ATENDIMENTO AO DEFICIENTE AUDITIVO: (55 11) 3171-3003

OUVIDORIA DO BANCO OURINVEST: 0800-603-4444

 


