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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: New PO
1 message

Kathy Sullivan <kathy.sullivan@sedanamedical.com> 26 January 2023 at 16:28
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

Thank you for update.

 

We will be using A-Sonic but before we book the pick up could you forward the commercial invoice.

 

Thanks,

Kathy

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Thursday, January 26, 2023 4:16 PM
To: Kathy Sullivan <kathy.sullivan@sedanamedical.com>
Subject: Re: New PO

 

Good afternoon Kathy,

 

Our warehouse team have asked me to let you know that we have two pallets ready for collection.

 

The weights and dimensions are as follows:

 

2 x pallets 120 cm x 80 cm x 170 cm high, 160 kg per pallet

Please could you let us know which pallet transport company you wish to use?

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, 20 Sept 2022 at 12:10, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Kathy,

 

Thank you for your order.

 

Please see attached proforma invoice as discussed with Ryan Swaine.  Please let me know if you require any
changes to be made.

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
https://eur02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Ftwitter.com%2FViamedLtd&data=05%7C01%7Ckathy.sullivan%40sedanamedical.com%7Cc2bfb688ac944c38c79308daffb8a988%7Cc428f30ebb4d445681a9963806cdf649%7C0%7C0%7C638103465828049808%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=EZVawZoOrQrj7z1vl1RNZg0V30RGd1EtmgK9IJxBt4k%3D&reserved=0
https://eur02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.viamed.co.uk%2Fpolicy&data=05%7C01%7Ckathy.sullivan%40sedanamedical.com%7Cc2bfb688ac944c38c79308daffb8a988%7Cc428f30ebb4d445681a9963806cdf649%7C0%7C0%7C638103465828049808%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=3s4bZESfG%2BaGzV%2FmJH45S5z5v4solOM1mUO24SigElk%3D&reserved=0
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk


26/01/2023, 16:38 Gmail - RE: New PO

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1744481523085972071%7Cmsg-f%3A175610322… 3/4

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, 20 Sept 2022 at 11:27, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Tue, 20 Sept 2022 at 10:49
Subject: Re: New PO
To: Kathy Sullivan <kathy.sullivan@sedanamedical.com>
Cc: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

 

Thank you very much Kathy

 

My colleague Kate will be in contact with your proforma invoice.

 

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Mon, 19 Sept 2022 at 10:53, Kathy Sullivan <kathy.sullivan@sedanamedical.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

Attached please find our new PO – please send request for payment to invoice@sedanamedical.com and Cc
myself.

 

Kind regards,

Kathy Sullivan | Purchasing & Planning Manager

📱 +353 87 1032039 | ✉ kathy.sullivan@sedanamedical.com

Sedana Medical Ltd | Unit 2A The Village Centre Two Mile House | Naas Co. Kildare | Ireland | W91 PWH5

☏ +353 (0)  45 879 081 | www.sedanamedical.com

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

This e-mail may be confidential. If you have received this e-mail in error please note that you may not copy or
use the contents or attachments in any way, and in that case please destroy this entire message and notify
the sender. E-mails are not secure and Sedana Medical Ltd cannot accept responsibility if they are
intercepted, diverted or corrupted or contain viruses. For more information about how Sedana Medical Ltd is
handling your personal data see our Privacy Policy on our Homepage. Sedana Medical Ltd. Registered in:
Dublin. No. 551564. Sedana Medical Ltd is a wholly owned subsidiary of Sedana Medical AB (publ).
Registered in: Danderyd. No. 556670-2519.

This e-mail may be confidential. If you have received this e-mail in error please note that you may not copy or use the
contents or attachments in any way, and in that case please destroy this entire message and notify the sender. E-
mails are not secure and Sedana Medical Ltd cannot accept responsibility if they are intercepted, diverted or
corrupted or contain viruses. For more information about how Sedana Medical Ltd is handling your personal data see
our Privacy Policy on our Homepage. Sedana Medical Ltd. Registered in: Dublin. No. 551564. Sedana Medical Ltd is
a wholly owned subsidiary of Sedana Medical AB (publ). Registered in: Danderyd. No. 556670-2519.
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