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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: New customer message on 10 January 2023 at 17:48
1 message

rob <rob@triton-grey.co.uk> 26 January 2023 at 14:26
To: pete@triton-grey.co.uk, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>, Holly <holly@triton-grey.co.uk>

Hi Ryan

Many thanks

If you drop an invoice Holly will get that sorted asap.
Please include your bank details for transfer.

Delivery address to

Triton Grey Ltd
Unit 17 Sandtoft Gateway
Sandtoft Road
Belton
Doncaster
DN9 1FA

Best Regards
Rob

On 26 Jan 2023, at 13:48, rob <rob@triton-grey.co.uk> wrote:

Please check they have these in stock and price

Begin forwarded message:

From: rob <rob@triton-grey.co.uk>
Subject: Re: New customer message on 10 January 2023 at 17:48
Date: 11 January 2023 at 17:48:34 GMT
To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Great stuff. 
Ill get qty details from our client.

Regards
rob

On 11 Jan 2023, at 10:53, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Rob

No, unfortunately not. However, I have a small batch in production that should be ready within 2
weeks.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 11 Jan 2023 at 14:36, Rob Grey <rob@triton-grey.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Ryan
Yes, thats the one
Do you have them in stock.

Regards
Rob

Sent from my iPhone
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On 11 Jan 2023, at 08:28, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

﻿
Hi Rob

Thank you very much for your message.

I believe the sensor that is used in the Analox 1000 is the 9212-2
Our compatible sensor is R-33VAN-2

Please let me know if you have any other questions.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 10 Jan 2023 at 17:48, Vandagraph (Shopify) <mailer@shopify.com> wrote:

You received a new message from your online store's contact form.

Country Code:
GB

Name:
rob grey

Email:
rob@triton-grey.co.uk

Phone Number:
07767367265

Message:
Hi
Can I clarify, before I order
Analox 1000 analysers, use the 9212-2 cell.??

Are these in stock.

Best Regards
rob
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