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Note: This is an internal email.

Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

RE: 60644
Milan Johnson <milan@gctbahrain.com> 24 January 2023 at 12:10
To: "aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk" <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, "iso@viamed.co.uk" <iso@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Regulatory <regulatory@gctbahrain.com>, Sibu George <sibu@gctbahrain.com>, "Harish Shyam (Orders Dep.)" <harish@gctbahrain.com>, Orders
<orders@gctbahrain.com>

Dear Aqib/Regulatory,

 

Please note, HS code: 90192000 require import approval from local authorities to arrange the customs clearance.

Kindly share the following documents. Also looping your regulatory team.

 

1.     Proforma Invoice should include HS Code & Country of Origin details.

2.     Quality Assurance Certificate (any of the below) should cover the scope & origin with the invoice.

From Legal Manufacturer

·         EC certificate (MDD Directive) issued by the listed body in European Commission.

OR

·         Certificate to Foreign Government (US FDA with exact part number available as per invoice)

&

·         ISO 13485 issued by the listed body in IAF (International Accreditation Forum)

In case, if Legal & Physical Manufacturer is different

·         EC certificate/CFG from Legal Manufacturer & ISO 13485 from Physical Manufacturer + Authorization letter issued by Physical Manufacturer to Invoicing Entity(Legal
Manufacturer).

OR
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·         If the Product is Class I - ISO 13485 from Physical manufacturer & Declaration of Conformity from Legal Manufacturer stating the product class.

3.     Brochure/Catalogue with Product ref# available.

4.     Product Label for all the products(Should include name of the Legal Manufacturer).

5.     Relation letter issued by Quality Certificate Holder (Applicable only if, Invoice issuing party differs from QC holder).

 

 

Regards,

 

Milan Johnson

Regulatory Affairs – Medical Device

 

O: +973 17 239 379   F: +973 17 232 230

E: regulatory@gctbahrain.com

 

P.O.Box: 2576, Bldg No: 2038, Road: 4156, Block:
341, Juffair, Kingdom of Bahrain

www.gctbahrain.com

 

mailto:regulatory@gctbahrain.com
http://www.gctbahrain.com/
https://www.linkedin.com/company/gulf-corporation-for-technology-w-l-l-/mycompany/
https://www.instagram.com/gctbahrain/
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Note: This is an internal email.

 

Medical Device Product Importation/Registration contact: regulatory@gctbahrain.com

Vigilance reporting/Field Safety Action contact: Quality@gctbahrain.com

Pharmaceutical related contact: pharmaregulatory@gctbahrain.com

 

From: Harish Shyam (Orders Dep.) <harish@gctbahrain.com>
Sent: Tuesday, January 24, 2023 2:46 PM
To: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Cc: Regulatory <regulatory@gctbahrain.com>; Sibu George <sibu@gctbahrain.com>
Subject: RE: 60644

 

 

Dear Aqib

 

Copying our Regulatory team to Advise

 

TKS

Harish

https://gctbahrain.com/
mailto:regulatory@gctbahrain.com
mailto:Quality@gctbahrain.com
mailto:pharmaregulatory@gctbahrain.com
mailto:harish@gctbahrain.com
mailto:aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
mailto:regulatory@gctbahrain.com
mailto:sibu@gctbahrain.com
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Note: This is an external email. Please take care when clicking links or opening attachments. When in doubt, contact IT Department

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed
Sent: Tuesday, January 24, 2023 2:44 PM
To: Harish Shyam (Orders Dep.) <harish@gctbahrain.com>
Subject: Re: 60644

 

 

Hello HArish 

 

Good morning 

 

We cannot write that HS code as that is not for what you have ordered, This HS code is for LED's.

 

The HS code that is suitable for your order is 9019209000.

 

Please let me know if you can accept this.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:harish@gctbahrain.com
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

 

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: Aqib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk>
To: "Harish Shyam (Orders Dep.)" <harish@gctbahrain.com>
Cc: 

https://checkpoint.url-protection.com/v1/url?o=http%3A//www.viamed.co.uk&g=NzJlYjQzZDk2ZmZhZWM0Yw==&h=YWVjNDExY2IwNTE2ZjU4NzU1MjlmYTgxMTVkMjQ0ZjFlNTEwY2M3NmI2NTZmYjBjMTFhYjE2MTAwYjljN2FiNg==&p=Y3AxZTpndWxmcGhhcm1hY2llczpjOm86NzBkZjg4MDk5MTg4ZDc2ZGJjOTBkNTc2OTc5N2ZjNzU6djE6aDpU
mailto:aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
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Note: This is an external email. Please take care when clicking links or opening attachments. When in doubt, contact IT Department

Bcc: 
Date: Mon, 16 Jan 2023 12:45:50 +0000
Subject: Re: 60644

Hello Harish

Good afternoon 

Please see below for your revised Proforma Invoice.

Can you confirm if all details are correct.

Please let me know if any changes are required.

I will get back to you regarding the HS code.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible. 

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------
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Note: This is an internal email.

Note: This is an external email. Please take care when clicking links or opening attachments. When in doubt, contact IT Department

On Mon, 16 Jan 2023 at 12:22, Harish Shyam (Orders Dep.) <harish@gctbahrain.com> wrote:

Thank you

 

Please share the revised PI

 

Shipment by FedEx Courier using our Account # 2263-6621-0   thru International Priority Service

 

KR

Harish

GCT - BAHRAIN

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed
Sent: Monday, January 16, 2023 3:11 PM
To: Harish Shyam (Orders Dep.) <harish@gctbahrain.com>
Subject: Re: 60644

 

 

Hello 

 

Good afternoon 

 

Yes I will remove them both.

mailto:harish@gctbahrain.com
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:harish@gctbahrain.com
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Could you please send us your fedex account number please.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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Note: This is an internal email.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 16 Jan 2023 at 12:00, Harish Shyam (Orders Dep.) <harish@gctbahrain.com> wrote:

 

Dear Sir

 

Thank you for your PI

 

Could you please remove – Insurance and bank charges

 

We shall bear all the charges

 

Please write the HS.Code 9033.0000 while shipment

 

 

TKS

Harish

https://checkpoint.url-protection.com/v1/url?o=http%3A//www.viamed.co.uk/policy&g=YjE1YTFhMjQ4ZTRlZjRkZA==&h=ZTFiZDQ3MDQwZWI1ZDhiYzI2Y2FjMGM5MzI1M2JiY2M5OTc5Mjk1MTRkMThiMmUxZGQ3MzJmMzViYTdkMTdmOA==&p=Y3AxZTpndWxmcGhhcm1hY2llczpjOm86MmRlMGQzZjc5NTZhNzNiOTg2MWZhZWY0OTAyNDU5ZDA6djE6aDpU
mailto:harish@gctbahrain.com
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Note: This is an external email. Please take care when clicking links or opening attachments. When in doubt, contact IT Department

GCT - BAHRAIN

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed
Sent: Monday, January 16, 2023 2:51 PM
To: Harish Shyam (Orders Dep.) <harish@gctbahrain.com>
Subject: 60644

 

 

Hello

 

Good morning 

 

Thank you for your order, 60644.

 

Please see below for your attached proforma invoice detailing the prices and product your are requiring.

 

Could you please send us your Fedex Courier account number so we can assign this order to that.

 

If you are happy with the proforma please pay the amount stated and we convert this to an order and get it ready for dispatch.

 

Please let me know if I can assist with anything else.

 

Kind regards

mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:harish@gctbahrain.com
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Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

https://checkpoint.url-protection.com/v1/url?o=http%3A//www.viamed.co.uk&g=MjRlNzA0NTg5YzAzOWFmYg==&h=ZTA3MGViNmYxMzk5ZjZhNDU4MDQ5NzNjZTg1ZWIxM2YyNDU0NWNkOGI2ZjUxMGMxNGI0MzZiOTQwNjcxODc5NQ==&p=Y3AxZTpndWxmcGhhcm1hY2llczpjOm86YzliZThiYzUwZGIyMDRiODE1OTY0NGIzZGE1NmY3ZDE6djE6aDpU
mailto:aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
https://checkpoint.url-protection.com/v1/url?o=http%3A//twitter.com/ViamedLtd&g=MGZjYzMwMWY1NTI1ZGI0OA==&h=YzNlNzdiMWI4MWVjOWU0MzY1NGMyOGM1ODc2NmM5NmNmNmM5MDQzODk1MTBkY2MzYjM1NjUzYjhjZmY5YTEzYg==&p=Y3AxZTpndWxmcGhhcm1hY2llczpjOm86YzliZThiYzUwZGIyMDRiODE1OTY0NGIzZGE1NmY3ZDE6djE6aDpU
https://checkpoint.url-protection.com/v1/url?o=http%3A//www.viamed.co.uk/policy&g=OGM5YTMzYjMyY2Y5NmExNA==&h=YjQ0MzY3M2Q2NzNkOGY2YjAzYjBkMzJjMGI3Mjk5ZWU4MjIxZTkyYWQ5ZmUzMjQ1M2JlOTFmMTE1Mzk4MmUyOA==&p=Y3AxZTpndWxmcGhhcm1hY2llczpjOm86YzliZThiYzUwZGIyMDRiODE1OTY0NGIzZGE1NmY3ZDE6djE6aDpU


24/01/2023, 15:53 Gmail - RE: 60644

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1755905776875893633&simpl=msg-f%3A1755905776875893633&mb=1 12/12

-----------------

2 attachments

MVM141391 (4).pdf
90K

Re: 60644.eml
184K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=07ddd72f30&view=att&th=185e3b0039be7381&attid=0.1.0.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=07ddd72f30&view=att&th=185e3b0039be7381&attid=0.1&disp=inline&safe=1&zw

