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Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>

Fwd: Pricing request for requisition number R2784938
Andrew Moore <Andrew.Moore@hscni.net> 24 January 2023 at 12:04
To: Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>

“This email is covered by the disclaimer found at the end of the message.”

________________________________

Hi Janine,

Thanks very much for getting back to me with this quotation.

Could I possibly get a few details amended please? These changes will be on the actual PO but I wanted to run them
past you first.

The invoice address is:

Belfast Health & Social Care Trust
PO Box 1045
BT42 9BU BALLYMENA
NORTHERN IRELAND
XI888808059

And the delivery address will be:

Main Stores
Belfast City Hospital
Lisburn Road
Belfast
BT9 7AB

Thanks in advance

Andrew Moore

Assistant Procurement Officer

Procurement and Logistics Service | 16 College Street | Belfast | BT1 6BT
Tel: 028 95361517 | Email: andrew.moore@hscni.net
Website: www.hscbusiness.hscni.net
Tender Opportunities advertised on: eTendersNI.gov.uk

-----Original Message-----
From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: 24 January 2023 09:11
To: Andrew Moore <Andrew.Moore@hscni.net>
Subject: Re: Pricing request for requisition number R2784938
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