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M Gmall Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

RE: Envirogen PO 51024 - Viamed - Revised PO

1 message

Procurement <procurement@envirogengroup.com> Mon, Jan 23, 2023 at 3:33 PM
To: "sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk" <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>, Procurement <procurement@envirogengroup.com>

Hi Sophie

Please find attached a copy of our revised order which has been increased from 250 to 500 sensors, carriage £24 and insurance @ 1% added also.

We have added carriage £24 and insurance together making it £106 total £130.

Many thanks
Em

Emily Jones

Purchasing Administrator

m: 07515994412
t: +44 (0) 1773 441029 % :.
0% & Process Filtration Experts  ENVIROGEN e g
& @ GRO
ENVIROGEN = EmilyJones@envirogengroup.com *®
GROUP
Wwww.envirogengroup.com
Your voice matters: Take our
customer survey
Envirogen Water Technologies Linked m Head Office: Unit 9 Wimsey Way Reg Number: 3289389
Ltd Alfreton Trading Estate, Derbyshire DE55 4LS VAT Number: GB 841026364

CONFIDENTIALITY AND WARNING NOTICE: The information sent by this communication is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender and delete this e-mail message from your system. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this
information is strictly prohibited. Envirogen Group S.A. cannot be held liable for the incorrect and/or incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication.

a7 Before Printing, please think about the Environment!
From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
Sent: 23 January 2023 14:52

To: Procurement <procurement@envirogengroup.com>
Subject: Re: Envirogen PO 51024 - Viamed

Hi Emily,

Thank you for your order 51024. | can confirm | have now processed this on our system, however we unfortunately do not have enough sensors in stock at the moment -
there may be a lead time of approximately 6 weeks, but we will try to improve on this where possible.

Please be aware, due to the quantity of sensors on your order, the delivery charge will be £24.00 plus VAT.

Finally - the shipment is currently on UPS' standard CPT (Carriage Paid To) delivery terms. This means that the shipment is not covered by insurance for loss or damage
once it leaves Viamed's premises.

Given the value of this order, would you like to upgrade the delivery to CIP (Carriage and Insurance Paid) by adding an additional insurance premium at 1% of total goods
value, i.e. £53.00?
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I look forward to hearing from you.

If you have any questions please do not hesitate to contact us.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http:/iwww.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, Jan 23, 2023 at 2:25 PM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Procurement <procurement@envirogengroup.com>

Date: Mon, 23 Jan 2023 at 14:16

Subject: Envirogen PO 51024 - Viamed

To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>, orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Procurement <procurement@envirogengroup.com>

Good Afternoon

Please can you process the attached PO and kindly confirm receipt of order and forward an order confirmation showing the lead time?

Many Thanks

Em

Emily Jones

Purchasing Administrator
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CONFIDENTIALITY AND WARNING NOTICE: The information sent by this communication is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender and delete this e-mail message from your system. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking any action in reliance on the contents of
this information is strictly prohibited. Envirogen Group S.A. cannot be held liable for the incorrect and/or incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication.
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«# Before Printing, please think about the Environment!

2 attachments

ﬁ 51024 - Viamed - Revised.pdf
197K

ﬂ 51024 - Viamed - Revised.pdf
197K
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