1/18/23, 10:10 AM Gmail - Re: New Order

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: New Order

1 message

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> 18 January 2023 at 10:08
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Good morning Kate,

Yes, above proforma invoice is confirm,please arrange the order process
Many thanks

Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Wed, Jan 18, 2023 at 3:03 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Sudath,

Thank you for your update.

Please see attached amended proforma invoice. If you are happy with it, please let me know and | can change it to
a confirmed order.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
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1/18/23, 10:10 AM Gmail - Re: New Order

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 18 Jan 2023 at 04:25

Subject: Re: New Order

To: <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sophie,
Thank you for your email, we need only

10 Pcs R-49V Oxygen sensor (0110049)
10 Pcs (2 boxes) Flow sensor A (4310001)

Can you arrange the above order? little urgent
Thanks & regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Tue, Jan 17, 2023 at 5:28 PM Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Sudath,

Thank you for your email. Kate is on annual leave today, so please accept my reply.

Please find attached your amended Proforma Invoice - | have added:

e 10x 0110049 - R-49V Oxygen sensors
e 2x 4310001 - Flowsensor (A) Box of 5

Please let me know if you are happy for us to proceed with your order or if you would like to make any further
changes.

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday
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1/18/23, 10:10 AM Gmail - Re: New Order
On Tue, Jan 17, 2023 at 8:22 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, 17 Jan 2023 at 04:49

Subject: Re: New Order

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Good Morning Kate,

Thank you for your email, sorry for the late reply

Please add to proforma invoice 10 Pcs (two boxes) Flow sensor model non autoclave (4310001) for testing
and 10 Pcs R-49V Oxygen sensors

Best regards,
Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Mon, Jan 16, 2023 at 5:03 PM Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Susath,

The non- autoclave flow sensors, part number 4310001 have the following price breaks:

1-9=£110.00 ([10-24 =£ 55.00 |[25-99 = £ 50.00 |[100-249 = £ 45.00 (250 or more = £
each each each each 40.00 each

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Mon, 16 Jan 2023 at 10:20, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Thank you for new proforma invoice,
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Gmail - Re: New Order

How is the price of non autoclave Flow sensor?
Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates

Sri Lanka.

On Mon, Jan 16, 2023, 3:14 PM Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Sudath,
Thank you for your order and payments.

Please see attached proforma invoice (using Skycargo Express and PayPal), if you are happy with it,
please let me know and | will change it to a confirmed order.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Sun, 15 Jan 2023 at 06:05, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Good Morning!

We need to order 10 Pcs R-49V Oxygen sensors & 10 Pcs Autoclavable Flow sensors (2 boxes)
Please send proforma invoice for above items,

Settleted part payments for RVM140967-1 (GBP-1436.83)

Already paid GBP-836.83, Need to settle GBP-600.00 we will arrange soon already informed to the

Account director.

Thank you,
Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.
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