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Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

RE: po 5894
1 message

Ruby Vijay <Ruby@carbon-clean.co.uk> 17 January 2023 at 08:51
To: Alan Cook <Alan@v-techuk.com>, "viamedinbox@gmail.com" <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Cc: "office@viamed.co.uk" <office@viamed.co.uk>, Ruby Vijay <Ruby@carbon-clean.co.uk>

Good Morning

Please call me on 020 3507 0175. We can make a card payment.

Kind Regards,

Ruby Vijay
Accounts

Phone:  +44 (0) 203 507 0175
Email: accounts@carbon-clean.co.uk
Address : Carbon Clean Ltd, 181 Forest Road Hainault, Essex, IG6 3HZ
carbon-clean.co.uk
       

“The best in class carbon cleaning solutions in the world!”

The contents of this e-mail are confidential and are intended only for the use of the recipient(s) unless otherwise
indicated. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender(s) immediately by telephone. Please
destroy and delete the message from your computer. Any form of reproduction, dissemination, copying, disclosure,
modification, distribution and/or publication of this e-mail is strictly prohibited unless expressly authorised by the
sender(s). No person, without written confirmation of the contents of this e-mail, should rely on it. Whilst this e-mail
and the information it contains are supplied in good faith, no member of Carbon Clean LTD shall be under any
liability in respect of the contents of this e-mail or for any reliance the recipient may place on it. This e-mail is sent
for information purposes only and shall not have the effect of creating a contract between the parties.

-----Original Message-----
From: Ruby Vijay <Ruby@carbon-clean.co.uk>
Sent: 12 January 2023 09:55
To: Alan Cook <Alan@v-techuk.com>; viamedinbox@gmail.com
Cc: Ruby Vijay <Ruby@carbon-clean.co.uk>
Subject: RE: po 5894

Good Morning

Thank you for your email.

Please call me on 020 3507 0175. We can make a card payment.

Kind Regards,

Ruby Vijay
Accounts

Phone:  +44 (0) 203 507 0175
Email: accounts@carbon-clean.co.uk
Address : Carbon Clean Ltd, 181 Forest Road Hainault, Essex, IG6 3HZ carbon-clean.co.uk
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“The best in class carbon cleaning solutions in the world!”

The contents of this e-mail are confidential and are intended only for the use of the recipient(s) unless otherwise
indicated. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender(s) immediately by telephone. Please
destroy and delete the message from your computer. Any form of reproduction, dissemination, copying, disclosure,
modification, distribution and/or publication of this e-mail is strictly prohibited unless expressly authorised by the
sender(s). No person, without written confirmation of the contents of this e-mail, should rely on it. Whilst this e-mail
and the information it contains are supplied in good faith, no member of Carbon Clean LTD shall be under any liability
in respect of the contents of this e-mail or for any reliance the recipient may place on it. This e-mail is sent for
information purposes only and shall not have the effect of creating a contract between the parties.

-----Original Message-----
From: Alan Cook <Alan@v-techuk.com>
Sent: 12 January 2023 09:49
To: Ruby Vijay <Ruby@carbon-clean.co.uk>
Subject: FW: po 5894

-----Original Message-----
From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: 12 January 2023 09:39
To: Alan Cook <Alan@v-techuk.com>
Cc: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>
Subject: Re: po 5894

Good Morning,

Thank you for your email.

Yes, you can pay by card.

If you can give me your phone number, I will pass it on to my colleague who will call you and make arrangements.

We don't have the card machine to hand so Cathy will need to call you.

Kind regards

Janine Gill
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy The information in this email is confidential and may be
legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
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On Thu, 12 Jan 2023 at 09:07, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
>
>
>
> ---------- Forwarded message ---------
> From: Alan Cook <Alan@v-techuk.com>
> Date: Thu, 12 Jan 2023 at 07:51
> Subject: RE: po 5894
> To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>
> Cc: Ruby Vijay <Ruby@carbon-clean.co.uk>, Accounts
> <Accounts@carbon-clean.co.uk>, Accounts <Accounts@v-techuk.com>
>
>
> Hi Sophie
>
>
>
> Can we make payment by card?
>
>
>
> Alan
>
>
>
> From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
> Sent: 16 December 2022 12:51
> To: Alan Cook <Alan@v-techuk.com>
> Subject: Re: po 5894
>
>
>
> Dear Alan,
>
>
>
> Thank you for your order. Please find attached your Proforma Invoice - I have checked the stock status and once
payment is received, your order could be dispatched within 1-2 working days. However, as you have stated you would
like delivery in the new year, we would forward date your order to a date specified.
>
>
>
> If any changes are required please let me know.
>
> Kind regards
>
> Sophie Lines
>
> Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday
>
> Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
>
> http://www.viamed.co.uk
> Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
> Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
> Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
> Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
> Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
>
> Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
>
> E-mail Disclaimer
> -----------------
> The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
> It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
> If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
>
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> If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be
> removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject
> line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
>
> GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
> -----------------
>
>
>
>
>
> On Fri, Dec 16, 2022 at 10:35 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
>
>
>
> ---------- Forwarded message ---------
> From: Alan Cook <Alan@v-techuk.com>
> Date: Fri, 16 Dec 2022 at 10:33
> Subject: po 5894
> To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>
> Cc: Jamie Warren <Jamie.warren@v-techuk.com>
>
>
>
> We would like this order to be dispatched in the new year.
>
>
>
> Regards
>
>
>
> Alan
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